" [P.0. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office

QUOTATION TABULATION - Page 1 of 3

Purchasing Section
Jennifer Miller, Buyer
(813) 247-8068

QUOTE NUMBER:
11-15 Inmate Personal Grooming Aids

True Uniform Supply Co.

Amercare Products, Inc.

Charm-Tex

Victory Supply, Inc.

1000/cs = $75.00

500/cs = 29.00

2000/cs = $129.00

2000/cs = $122.63

P.O. Box 25874 & (17661 128th PI. NE 5 |1618 Coney Island Ave. § 165 A Trade St. &
Opened: April 29, 2015 Scottsdale, AZ 85255 § Woodinville, WA 98072 ‘5 Brooklyn, NY 11230 £ |Lexington, KY 40511 E
[} o) ° ©
IAwarded: May 28, 2015 Aaron Tucker E, Julie Siegel a Stan Danzger alMegan King ?-.
Ph; 888-291-7602 2 |Ph: 800-556-6322 o |Ph: 718-252-8100 S |Ph: 859-266-1031 =
Terms: One Year Initial Award Fx; 623-738-2009 Q |Fx: 800-525-4042 g Fx: 718-258-8303 Q IFx; 859-2661036 e
Three (3) Annual Renewals aaron@trueuniform.com g— julie@amercareproducts.net & [stan@charm-tex.com g megan@victorysupplyinc.com g
(YELLOW AREA INDICATES AWARD) 2 < =2 2
DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS: A B C D
True C5 Amercare C-5 H/CS VSI/SUCS
Comb: 57, black, unbreakable, bulk packed $0.0148/each N $0.0155/each Y $0.01708/each N $0.0137/each N
2160/case = $31.25 2160/cs = $33.48 2160/cs = $36.90 2160/cs = $29.64
. . : True CG6 Amerfresh TP-06-G CT H/CTPO060 (Note 1) VSI/SUGTP06
;:\:,;rhe‘:lait: a(r)u?n::l;oe rf,’: 3;;‘853.}1 l;:;;:jmt $0.1275/each Y $0.089/each N $0.08244/each N $0.1178/each N
0 ¥P ' 720/cs = $91.80 720/cs = $64.08 720/cs = $59.36 720/cs = $84.84
Toothbrush: travel size (approx. 4"), no cover, True TBSH Amercare TB-SH H/TB20 VSI/SUTB20I(
individually wrapped, 33 tuft or better, bulk $0.0399/each N $0.034/each Y $0.031875/each N $0.0331/each N
packed 1440/cs = $57.50 1440ics = $48.96 1440/cs = $45.90 1440/cs = $47.69
True RAZ2 Amercare RAZ-2 H/DRO5 VSI/SUERS500
|Razor: disposable, twin blade, bulk packed $0.075/each N $0.058/each N $0.06495/each N $0.0613/each Y

Samples Received with Bid Package Yes Yes Yes Yes
Business Days to Delivery ARO 10 7t0 10 7to14 71010
EXCEPTIONS None None None None

Note 1: Not clear tube as specified.

Note 2: Razor "I' awarded over razor “E” due to better quality {cover). E is technically acceptable but not preferred per Capt. Herman, Detention. JM




P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office

QUOTATION TABULATION - Page 2 of 3

Purchasing Section
Jennifer Miller, Buyer
(813) 247-8068

[QUOTE NUMBER:
11-15 Inmate Personal Grooming Aids

ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.

Advanced Educational Producte

Justice Packaging Corp.

GCS Suppilies, Inc.

2000/cs = $82.00

1000/cs = $64.00

1000/cs = $64.36

1000/cs = $65.00

P.O. Box 21056 & |[2495 Main St., Ste 230 & |P.0. Box 643 G (28862 Gamet Hill Ct. S

Opened: April 29, 2015 Waco, TX 76702 5 Buffalo, NY 14214 :.:; Pooler, GA 31322 :;c_, Agoura Hilis, CA 91301 <
® 0] © ©

Awarded: May 28, 2015 ?., Leah Butzek E, Susan Hagan 2, Cindy Shulman ‘i

Ph: 800-524-5427 f; Ph: 800-344-1522 ext 30 :; Ph: 800-253-2352 g Ph: 888-242-3894 g
Terms: One Year Initial Award Fx: 254-751-0299 Q |Fx: 716-446-5642 Q@ |Fx: 866-554-2569 2 [Fx: 818-991-5954 o
Three (3) Annual Renewals g Ibutzek@aeppersonal care.com g susan@justicepkg.com g cindy@gcssupplies.com %
(YELLOW AREA INDICATES AWARD) < 2 < 2
DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS: E F G H

ICS-T123 New World Imports C5 80100 C5
Comb: 5", black, unbreakable, bulk packed $0.139/each Y $0.0148/each N $0.0159/each Y $0.13888/each N
2160/cs = $30.00 2160/cs = $32.00 2160/cs = $34.50 2160/cs = $30.00
A . . Freshmint GTP06 New World Imports CG6 90430 TP6A
e g;?pf;iit'ccts“‘s;’k";g‘;k e $0.1414/each Y $0.1166/each Y $0.115/each Y $0.07909/each \
’ ’ 720/cs = $101.83 720/cs = $84.00 720/cs = $83.11 720/cs = $56.95
Toothbrush: travel size (approx. 4"), no cover, ICS-TBSH New World Importe TBSH 30155 TBSH-30 TUFT
individually wrapped, 33 tuft or better, bulk $0.0326/each N $0.0354/each Y $0.0317/each N $0.04/each N
packed 144/cs = $4.70 1440/cs = $51.00 1440/cs = $45.67 144/cs = $5.76
ICS-T100 AEP TXD3001RP5 20305 RAZ2

Razor: disposable, twin blade, bulk packed $0.041/each {Note 2) Y $0.064/each N $0.064/each N $0.065/each N

Samples Received with Bid Package Yes Yes Yes Yes
Business Days to Delivery ARO 4t07 7t0 10 3to5 7

Due to shipping costs, quote is
EXCEPTIONS None None None for all-or-none award.

Toothpaste must be minimum

order of 54 cases at a time.

Note 1: Not clear tube as specified.

Note 2: Razor "I" awarded over razor "E" due to better quality (cover). E is technically acceptable but not preferred per Capt. Herman, Detention. JM
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QUOTE NUMBER:
11-15 Inmate Personal Grooming Aids

American Amenities, Inc.

Bob Barker Co., Inc.

RESPECT of Florida, Inc.

McKesson Medical-Surgical

19510 144th Ave. NE & (134 N. Main St. & [2475 Apalachee Pkwy, Ste 205 § 8121 10th Ave. N. 5
Opened: April 29, 2015 Suite C-7 ‘g Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526 ;C'; Tallahassee, FL. 32301 5 Golden Valley, MN 55427 E
Woodinville, WA 98072 g g J g ©
Awarded: May 28, 2015 Andy Chuang — |Garrett Riley > |Denise Frederick ~ |Rebecca Osbome 2
Ph: 425-489-1899 o |Ph: 866-463-8514 5 |Ph: 850-942-3575 o [Ph: 800-328-8111 ~
Terms: One Year Initial Award Fx: 485-487-2939 Q|Fx: 800-332-7537 g Fx: 850-656-0168 2 [Fx: 800-237-9766 o
Three (3) Annual Renewals andy@aai-info.com g garrettriley@bobbarker.com & |dfrederick@respectoffiorida.org g rebecca.osborne@ g
(YELLOW AREA INDICATES AWARD) < & & mckesson.com &
DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS: | J K N/A
Mega Fresh C5 Bob Barker C5B PSS Medical 222061
Comb: 5", black, unbreakable, bulk packed $0.0167/each N $0.0175/each N $0.0384/each N
2160/cs = $36.07 2160/cs = $37.70 2160/cs = $51.32 No Bid
. N . Mega Fresh TP-06C Maximum Security MS306 Oraline JMCG6
Kt $0.0872leach v $0.1350/each N $0.4724/each v No Bid
: P et 720ics = $62.78 144/cs = $19.44 720/cs = $160.64
Toothbrush: travel size (approx. 4"), no cover, Mega Fresh TB-32ST Bob Barker TH42 Oraline 90036
individually wrapped, 33 tuft or better, bulk $0.0361/each N $0.0650/each Y $0.8145/each Y No Bid
packed 1440/cs = $51.98 72/cs = $4.68 144/cs = $27.40
Mega Fresh RAZ-025 Maximum Security CLTB600 PSS Medical 222061
|Razor: disposable, twin blade, bulk packed $0.058/each (Note 2) |Y $0.0645/each Y $0.0801/each Y No Bid
1000/cs = $58.00 600/cs = $38.72 500/cs = $40.09
Samples Received with Bid Package Yes Yes Yes N/A
|Business Days to Delivery ARO 14 7 to 14 15
Toothbrush: 3" with thumb handle,
40 tufts
ECLELICRE Noge Razor: one case of 600 is 6 boxes None
of 100/each

Note 1: Not clear tube as specified.

Note 2: Razor "I" awarded over razor "E" due to better quality {cover). E is technically acceptable but not preferred per Capt. Herman, Detention. JM




