Bryan CHANDLER

BUYER

(§15) 247- 5957

= HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY
oo SHERIFF’S OFFICE

D008 EAST EXCHTH A VENUE
Taupa, FL 33605

FINANCLAL SERVICES DIVISION
ORIEENT ROAD WAREHOUSE

BCHANDLER@TEAMHCSO.com

IBID 2022-015 Janitorial Supplies

Opened: February 17, 2023 Clean Space Project Central Poly-Bag Corp Hemera Holding LLC Interboro Packaging Pyramid School Products | Sani-Chem Cleaning Supplies Unipak Corp.
Awarded: March 29, 2023 4280 Dow Rd, #104 2400 Bedle Place 631 Progress Way 114 Bracken Rd 6510 North 54th Street 1950 Calumet St PO Box 332
Initial Term Expires: Melbourne, FL 32934 Linden, NJ 07036 Sanford, FL 32771 Montgomery, NY 12549 Tampa, FL 33610 Clearwater, FL 33765 West Long Branch, NJ 07764
Renewal 1 Expires: March 28, 2025
Renewal 2 Expires: Inichelle@cleanspaceproject.cor| orders@centralply.com| ceo@hemeraholding.com Jabraham@interboropackaging.con] orders@pyramidsp.com orders@sani-chem.com customercare@unipakcorp.netj
Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award 303-619-2136 908-862-7570 407-432-4306 845-782-6800 813-621-7688 727-461-2546 888-808-5120
Three (3) Annual Renewals Michelle Doza Nicole Lawson Nicole Pidanick Chava Kaufman Mandy Furlon Jenny Herron Brian Marcus
(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)
ITEM NUMBER - DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS:
$7.98 ea / 12 per case
00080 _|Broom - Metal-Free, Straw, 38" Broom WOETY WO NOBID NOBID ABCO #BR10037 LI NOBID
$7.89 ea/ 12 per case
00082 _|Broom Head - Push - 18" NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID Bebler Brush #100118 e NOBID
$2.59 ea / 24 per case
00108 _|Hand Held Plastic Dust Pan - Black NOEIY O NOBID NOBID Rubbermaid #FG2005 e NOBID
$3.89 ea / 12 per case
00350 |Snap on Wire Dust Mop Frame - 24"x5" NOEHD NOEHD NOEHD NOEHD ABCO #BH24524WF S e NOEID
$5.99 ea / 12 per case
00135 |Mop Handle - Dust - Wood Handle, 60" Swivel Snap NOEND NOEHD NOEHD NOEHD ABCO #01406NB Bivea NOE
$3.19 ea / 12 per case
Push Broom Wood Handle - 60"- threaded NOBID NOBID NOBID NOBID ABCO #01102 S ke NOBID
$59.98 ea *
00477 _|Mop Bucket w/Wringer - 35 qt. metal free NOEND NOEHD NOEHD NOEHD Continental #335-312 S NOE
$3.49 ea/ 12 per case
00085 |Brush - Pot Scrubber, 8-8 1/2 handle in wood with Poly bristles MO 31D MDD MO 31D MO 3D ABCO #00001 MO 31D MDD
Pad - Scouring - Medium Duty Green Pad Antimicrobial 6"x9" (20 pads $6.59 per case / 20 per cs.
00144 |per case) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ACS #96-601 $8.29 per case / 20 per case NO BID
$2.59 ea / 5 per case
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.44 ea / 5 per case NO BID
00312 |Pad Polishing, 20" Chanpagne Hi-speed pad ACS #42-20
) ) _ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID B el B e G $3.14 ea / 5 per case NO BID
00143 _|Pad - Buffing, Buffing Pads, 20" diameer, Red ACS #51-20
$2.59 ea / 5 per case
00145 _|Pad - Strip/scrub, Stripping Floor Pads, 20" . Black NOEHD NOEID N EN NOEN ACS #7220 BieaSpareEs NOED
$56.98 per case * i
00096 | Cleaner - Stainless Steel- wipes (6pl/40 wipes in each case) WO 31D MDD MO 31D MO 31D Chase #5505 TR e G 2O WS MDD
Cleaner - Abrasive Powder- 21 oz Bleach Cleanser (24x21 oz in each $40.98 per case *
00098 |case) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID BABO #P752088 NO BID NO BID
$37.98 per case *
00178 |Furniture Polish - Spray, 19 oz can (12 cans in a case) WO EHD NOEID WO EHD NOEHD Chase #433-4109 aacas NOEID
Pump Dispenser (ounce pump), White Plastic, Bulk Liquids, thraded, $2.59 ea / 24 per case
00346 |145" H, 2" W NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Crayola #54-2129 NO BID NO BID
Toilets Plunger - Forced Cup Plunger; Durable Rubber, 6" cup diamter, $5.29 ea / 12 per case
00575 |21 Wood Handle NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Impact #9200 NO BID NO BID
$55.98 each / 4 per case
00089 | Trash Can - 40 Gal Square, Gray, 40 gal y, 27" W, 27" H NOED MO NOED NOED Rubbermaid #FG3536 NOE NOED
$21.98/ 4 per case
00340 |Trash Can Lid, Square, Flat, For 40 Gal Container, Plastic MO 31D MDD MO 3D MO 3D Rubbermiad #FG3539 NOEID NOEID
Microfber Cleaning Towels 16"x16" Multi-Surface Microfiber Towel (12 $7.08 per case / 12 in case
new item |pisces in each case) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Monarch #M91510786 $7.20 each / 12 per case NO BID
$6.49 each / 12 per case
new item [Microfiber Hand Duster N EN NOEID N EN N EN Better Brush #1764828 N EN NOE
$33.48 per case / 12 pr cs.
new item |Perforated General Purpose Safety Goggles (12 per case) NOEHD NOEHID NG EHD NOEHID Cordova #GI10 NOEHD NOEHID
$36.98 per case $42.00 per case /
new item [Sprayaway A Free Spray Foam Glass Cleaner (12 in each case) N EH NOE N EN N EN Chase #433-4101 12 per case NOE
$4.49 ea
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.69 ea / 12 per case NO BID
00138 |Dust Mop Head - 24"x5" Swivel Snap, 4-Ply Yarn, Launderable g i SLSL M24-5B
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.89 ea / 12 per case B e NO BID
00133 |Deck Mop - 32 oz - Size #16 - Handle 7/8" CS-50016
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.21 ea / 12 per case e NO BID
00137 |Mop Head - #24 cotton cut-end $020 #24
_ _ o NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID No Sample Sent b opjeach NO BID
00638 |Mop Head - Jail - 24 oz, size large with wide band WT2-24-5BL
Mop Handle - 60" - Quick Change Side-Latch Plastic Mop Head Handle, $6.35 each
00121 | Aluminum Yellow NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Item not as requested 01205.NB NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.29 ea / 12 per case Eisleach NO BID
00083 |Brush - Floor Scrubber - 10" Wide, Stiff Palmyra Deck Brush #0008
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.17 ea / 12 per case $1£:0:;°h NO BID
00088 |Brush- Toilet Bowl - 14"x17" White Poly, Commercial grade, metal free 1
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Ot Ao

0 $48.19 per case
00095 _|Cleaner - Glass (4x1 gal in each case) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $51.96 per case P126 NO BID
$51.84 per case / 12 per cs
00104 |Disinfectant Spary, 15.5 oz can (12 pk in case) MO 31D MO MO 31D MO 3D o St St Sparsan Q NOEID
Plastic Bottle - 32 oz, with Graduations, 28/400, trigger dip tube length 9 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID No Sample Sent $0.92 each NO BID
00061 [3/4" Heavy-Duty 550732
$0.69 each
00224 | Plastic Bottle Sprayer - Fits 32 oz bottles, 28/400 mm neck, Natural WO EHD NOEID WO EHD NOEHD NOEID 550610 NOED
Gloves - Cotton Work, knit Gloces; uncoated cotton/polyester, Jersey NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.79 per ea pair / 12 pair per $0.62 ;')er ea pair / NO BID
00111 |Task & Chore case 12 pair per case
new item |Simple Green. 1 gal. C. d All-Purose Cleaner, (4x1 gal in ea. cs. N EH NOE N EN N EN SERIED (P G20 BB R EED NOE
new item | Palmoive Pr 1 gal dish liquid (4x1 gal in each case) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $95.96 per case $54.98 per case NO BID
) .Fabuloso 1-gal Liquied All-Purpose Cleaners, assorted scents (4x1 gal NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $38.80 per case NO BID
new item [in each case)
$2.24 ea
new item |18: Microfiber Mop NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $94.68 case / 12 per case MMS-18ZL NO BID
$26.88 per case /
new item [18" Microfiber mop pad refill, launderable 912 per case) N EH NOE N EN N EN NG el 2 per e 12 per case NOED
$2.84ea/
new item |ZEP Acidic Toilet Bowl Cleaner, 32 oz, goose-neck bottle MO 31D MO MO 31D MO 3D MO 12 per case MDD
Gloves - High Risk- Size Small. Disposable Nitrile Exam Gloves, 5+ mil, $39.99 per case / $34.00 per case / 1) Med Pride/ Shield $2.80 per box $38.00 per case /
00632 |Exam Grade, Powder Free, Latex Free $3.99 per box NOBID $3.40 per box 2) Med Pride / Shield $2.80 per box No Sample Sent S $3.80 per box
Gloves - High Risk- Size Med. Disposable Nitrile Exam Gloves, 5+ mil, $39.99 per case / $34.00 per case / 1) Med Pride/ Shield $2.70 per box $38.00 per case /
00633 |Exam Grade, Powder Free, Latex Free $3.99 per box NOEHD $3.40 per box 2) Sri Trang $2.30 per box o e St A [y L $3.80 per box
Gloves - High Risk- Size Lg. Disposable Nitrile Exam Gloves, 5+ mil, $39.99 per case / $34.00 per case / 1) Med Pride/ Shield $2.70 per box $38.00 per case /
00634 |Exam Grade, Powder Free, Latex Free $3.99 per box WO $3.40 per box 2) Sri Trang $2.30 per box NOEETDEE e perien $3.80 per box
Gloves - High Risk- Size XL. Disposable Nitrile Exam Gloves, 5+ mil, $39.99 per case / $34.00 per case / 1) Med Pride/ Shield $2.70 per box $38.00 per case /
00635 |Exam Grade, Powder Free, Latex Free $3.99 per box NOEHD $3.40 per box 2) Sri Trang $2.30 per box Mo EmplD Sl e pey e $3.80 per box
Gloves - High Risk- Size 2xI. Disposable Nitrile Exam Gloves, 5+ mil, $34.00 per case / $43.00 per case /
00636 |Exam Grade, Powder Free, Latex Free MOEHD NOED $3.40 per box MOEHD Nt SETTFD e B e e $4.30 per box
$18.24 per case
00128 |Trash Bag - 24" 10 gal Capacity, 24"W, 24" H, 8 micron thick, clear, PK 1 NO BID $11.20 per case NO BID NO BID $19.99 per case $17.90 per case
$27.92 per case
00127 _|Trash Bag - 48" 45 gal 40"x48", 16 micron, clear, PK 250 NO BID $22.40 per case NO BID NO BID $32.64 per case $26.90 per case
Infectious Waste Bag-Red Bioh d bags, 10 gal capactiy, 24"W, 24" H
00030 |Infectious waste, Lidpe, 250 PK NO BID $35.00 per case NO BID $20.82 per case NO BID NO BID NO BID
Isolation Bag - Yellow, Biohazard bags, 44 gal capacity, 37"W, 50"H,
00031 |infecti Linen, HDPE, 200 PK NO BID $70.00 per case NO BID $45.82 per case NO BID NO BID NO BID
Soap Dispenser - Wall-mounted, Clear View Dispenser; Liquid, 30 oz
00105 |Refill Size NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Item not as requested NO BID NO BID
Delivery Days ARO 6-7 Days ARO 30 Days ARO 4-6 Days ARO 14-21 Days ARO 7 Days
Full Cases Only N
Exceptions None None None None unless noted (*) one None

Change Order #1 - Remove award for Item-00636, Gloves-High Risk Size 2XL
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