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 Initial

TC NUMBER: 2025-017 HCSO Supplier SI-301670 HCSO Supplier SI-262246 HCSO Supplier SI-245655 HCSO Supplier SI-301668

Rubrix LLC Life-Assist Inc North American Rescue LLC Kentron Healthcare
Initial Award: December 30, 2025 9:00AM EST. 501 Congress Ave. Ste 150 11277 Sunrise Park Drive 35 Tedwall Court PO Box 120
Change Order #: Austin, Texas 78701 Rancho Cordova, CA Greer, SC 29650 Springfield, TN 37172
Renewal 1 EXP: United States of America United States of America United States of America United States of America
Renewal 2 EXP:
Renewal 3 EXP: John Adams Customer Care Devon Pless Nari Sadarangani

(512)581-5513 (800)824-6016 (864) 704-0510 (615)384-0573 
Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award connect@rubrix.com customercare@life-assist.com dpless@narescue.com Kentron@kentronmedical.com

A

$35.40ea NcSTAR First 
Responder Utility Bag Item# 

CVFRB2918B 1 per case 
Min order: 1 Delivery ARO 7-

10 Days

$105.00ea 5.11 UCR Sling 
Pack Sling Pack Item# 

CS56298ABR-BLK Min 
order: $100 total Delivery 

ARO 2-7 Days

$39.98ea NcStar First 
Responder BLK Item# 80-
0456 Min order: 1 Delivery 

ARO 2-3 weeks

$48.49ea NCSTAR Item# 
CVFRB2918B 20 per case                

Min order:10, Delivery ARO 
30 Days

B

$56.85ea Tac-Med Item# 84-
0009 SOF Tourniquet Blk 

Min order: 1 Delivery ARO 7-
10 Days 

$24.25ea North American 
Rescue Combat Application 
Tourniquet Item# TQ0001-
BLK Min order: $100 total 

Delivery ARO 2-7 Days 

$24.98ea North American 
Rescue Item# 30-0001 Min 
order: 1 Delivery ARO 3-5 

Days

$26.69ea North American 
Rescue Item# 30-0001 100 

per case Min order: 50, 
Delivery ARO 15 Days

C
$29.75ea Item# 5020-0025 

Min order: 1 Delivery ARO 7-
10 Days

$33.99ea Item# BA7350, 50 
per case Min order: $100 total 

Delivery ARO 2-7 Days 

$34.98ea Item# 30-0039 Min 
order: 1 Delivery ARO 3-5 

Days

$37.19ea Item# Z350 50 per 
case Min order: 50, Delivery 

ARO 14 Days

Trauma Kits

Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewal
HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Opened: October 21, 2025

Trauma Response Bag (00622)

Tourniquet Combat Application 
(CAT), black in color (00614)

Quikclot Combat Gauze (00615)        
Quik Qlot combat gauze, z-folded 
3"x 4 yards. (Alternate brands not 
accepted)

mailto:connect@rubrix.com
mailto:customercare@life-assist.com
mailto:dpless@narescue.com
mailto:Kentron@kentronmedical.com
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 Initial

TC NUMBER: 2025-017 HCSO Supplier SI-301670 HCSO Supplier SI-262246 HCSO Supplier SI-245655 HCSO Supplier SI-301668

Rubrix LLC Life-Assist Inc North American Rescue LLC Kentron Healthcare
Initial Award: December 30, 2025 9:00AM EST. 501 Congress Ave. Ste 150 11277 Sunrise Park Drive 35 Tedwall Court PO Box 120
Change Order #: Austin, Texas 78701 Rancho Cordova, CA Greer, SC 29650 Springfield, TN 37172
Renewal 1 EXP: United States of America United States of America United States of America United States of America
Renewal 2 EXP:
Renewal 3 EXP: John Adams Customer Care Devon Pless Nari Sadarangani

(512)581-5513 (800)824-6016 (864) 704-0510 (615)384-0573 
Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award connect@rubrix.com customercare@life-assist.com dpless@narescue.com Kentron@kentronmedical.com

Trauma Kits

Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewal
HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Opened: October 21, 2025

   D
$26.75ea Item# 10-0037 Min 
order: 1  Delivery ARO 7-10 

Days

$13.00ea Item# AT0037 Min 
order: $100 total Delivery 

ARO 2-7 Days 

$12.08ea Item# 10-0037 Min 
order: 1 Delivery ARO 3-5 

Days

$15.49ea Item# 10-0037 25 
per case Min order: 10, 
Delivery ARO 15 Days

E

$26.15ea Rhino Rescue 6" 
Israeli Style Emergency 
Bandage, Compression 

Trauma Wound Dressing 2pk 
Min order: 1  Delivery ARO 

7-10 Days

$8.25ea Teleflex QuikClot 
EMS 4"x4" Dressing Item# 
BA0636, 10 boxes per case 

Min order: $100 total,         
Delivery ARO 2-7 Days 

$5.58ea North American  
Dressing Emergency trauna 
4" (Flat) Item# 30-0093 Min 
order: 1 Delivery ARO 3-5 

Days

$4.99ea Dynarex #3683 High 
strength pressure dressing 50 

per case Delivery ARO 15 
Days

F

$7.30ea McKesson Woven 
Gauze Sponges Sterile, 8ply 
100% Cotton, 4in x4in 2pk 
Item# 16-4248 Min order: 1 

Delivery ARO 7-10 Days

$5.50 (bag of 200) Dukal 
Gauze Sponge 4"x4" 12ply 
Non-Sterile Item# BA4144 

Min order: $100 total,  
Delivery ARO 2-7 Days 

$3.68ea North American 
Rescue Gauze Non-Sterile 

4:x4" pack of 200 Item# 30-
0157 Delivery ARO 3-5 Days

$0.015ea Kentron 4"x4" 8ply 
gauze Item #448111, 

200/pack case Min order: 200 
Delivery ARO

Hyfin Ven Twin Pack - Chest Seal 
(00617)  (Alternate brands not 
accepted)

Gauze - Non-sterile, 4"x4"(00619)

Emergency Trauma Dressing 
4"(02057)

mailto:connect@rubrix.com
mailto:customercare@life-assist.com
mailto:dpless@narescue.com
mailto:Kentron@kentronmedical.com
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 Initial

TC NUMBER: 2025-017 HCSO Supplier SI-301670 HCSO Supplier SI-262246 HCSO Supplier SI-245655 HCSO Supplier SI-301668

Rubrix LLC Life-Assist Inc North American Rescue LLC Kentron Healthcare
Initial Award: December 30, 2025 9:00AM EST. 501 Congress Ave. Ste 150 11277 Sunrise Park Drive 35 Tedwall Court PO Box 120
Change Order #: Austin, Texas 78701 Rancho Cordova, CA Greer, SC 29650 Springfield, TN 37172
Renewal 1 EXP: United States of America United States of America United States of America United States of America
Renewal 2 EXP:
Renewal 3 EXP: John Adams Customer Care Devon Pless Nari Sadarangani

(512)581-5513 (800)824-6016 (864) 704-0510 (615)384-0573 
Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award connect@rubrix.com customercare@life-assist.com dpless@narescue.com Kentron@kentronmedical.com

Trauma Kits

Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewal
HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Opened: October 21, 2025

   G

$26.75ea Rhino Rescue 
Sterile Compressed Gauze for 
Emergency Wound Dressing 
Item# CR-CG01 Min order: 

1, 2 per case Delivery ARO 7-
10 Days

$2.75ea North American 
Rescue Wound Packing 

Gauze Z-Fold 3"x5yrd Item# 
BA30054 Min order: $100 

total Delivery ARO 2-7 Days 

$2.98ea North American 
Rescue Gauze NAR  Wound 
Packing 3"x5yrd Item# 30-
0054 Min order: 1 Delivery 

ARO 3-5 Days

$3.79ea North American Item 
#30-0054 10/pack case Min 
orer: 10 Delivery ARO 15 

Days

H 

$12.25ea Li Jui 7.5inch, 
Bandage Scissors fluoride-

coated with Non-Stick Blades 
Item# 42291615 Min order: 1 

Delivery ARO 7-10 Days

$31.75ea XShear 7.5" Heavy 
Duty Trauma Shears Black 
Titanium Item# IN50188-
BLKMin order: $100 total 
Delivery ARO 2-7 Days 

$3.28ea North American 
Rescue Responder Trauma 

Shears (LRG) 7-1/4" Blk/Sil 
Item# ZZ-1019 Min order: 1 

Delivery ARO 3-5 Days

$.89ea Kentron Item# KI141-
07 7 1/2" Trauma Scissors 

24/box per case Min order: 24 
Delivery ARO 15 Days

I

$15.85ea Mini Duct Tape 
Rolls Grey/Silver 2 inchx 20 
feet(3pd) Min order: 1, 3 per 

case Delivery ARO 7-10 
Days

$8.00ea Ernest Packaging 
White Duct Tape, 2" Item# 
TA6000, 24 per case Min 
order: $100 total Delivery 

ARO 2-7 Days

$1.78ea North American Duct 
Tape Mini 2"x100" Iterm# 

ZZ-0084 Min order: 1 
Delivery ARO 3-5 Days

$3.99ea Generic brand Mini 
Duct Tape 1.77"x 10 feet 

Item# DT998877, 4/box per 
case Min order: 4 rolls,              
Deliver ARO 15 Days

Trauma Shears (00620)

Mini Duct Tape (00618)

Gauze - NAR Wound Packing 3"x 
5yrd (02153)

mailto:connect@rubrix.com
mailto:customercare@life-assist.com
mailto:dpless@narescue.com
mailto:Kentron@kentronmedical.com
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 Initial

TC NUMBER: 2025-017 HCSO Supplier SI-301670 HCSO Supplier SI-262246 HCSO Supplier SI-245655 HCSO Supplier SI-301668

Rubrix LLC Life-Assist Inc North American Rescue LLC Kentron Healthcare
Initial Award: December 30, 2025 9:00AM EST. 501 Congress Ave. Ste 150 11277 Sunrise Park Drive 35 Tedwall Court PO Box 120
Change Order #: Austin, Texas 78701 Rancho Cordova, CA Greer, SC 29650 Springfield, TN 37172
Renewal 1 EXP: United States of America United States of America United States of America United States of America
Renewal 2 EXP:
Renewal 3 EXP: John Adams Customer Care Devon Pless Nari Sadarangani

(512)581-5513 (800)824-6016 (864) 704-0510 (615)384-0573 
Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award connect@rubrix.com customercare@life-assist.com dpless@narescue.com Kentron@kentronmedical.com

Trauma Kits

Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewal
HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Opened: October 21, 2025

   

$143.98ea North American 
Rescue Trauma Response Blk-

HCSO Item# 85-0934 Min 
order: 1 Delivery ARO 3-5 

Days

$160ea Motion Medical 
Custom Truma Kit Item# 
KT1561 Min order: $100 
total Delivery ARO 5-14 

Days

J

1- Item C Quickclot Combat Gauze

1- Item D Hyfin Vent Chest Seal $194.69ea Kentron Item# 
TK10 50per case                

Min order: 50                 
Delivery ARO 30 Days

$237.05ea Rubrix Item# 
RA687134 Min order: 1 
Delivery ARO 7-10 Days1- Item E Emergency Trauma 

Dressing 4"

1- Item F Gauze -Non Sterile 4"x4" 
8ply 200ct

3- Item G Gauze - Wound Packing 
3"x5yrd

Trauma Response Kit (00613)

1- Item A: Carrying Bag

2- Item B Tourniquet Combat 
Application(CAT)

1- Item H Trauma Shears

1- Item I Mini Duct Tape

mailto:connect@rubrix.com
mailto:customercare@life-assist.com
mailto:dpless@narescue.com
mailto:Kentron@kentronmedical.com
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 Initial

TC NUMBER: 2025-017 HCSO Supplier SI-301670 HCSO Supplier SI-262246 HCSO Supplier SI-245655 HCSO Supplier SI-301668

Rubrix LLC Life-Assist Inc North American Rescue LLC Kentron Healthcare
Initial Award: December 30, 2025 9:00AM EST. 501 Congress Ave. Ste 150 11277 Sunrise Park Drive 35 Tedwall Court PO Box 120
Change Order #: Austin, Texas 78701 Rancho Cordova, CA Greer, SC 29650 Springfield, TN 37172
Renewal 1 EXP: United States of America United States of America United States of America United States of America
Renewal 2 EXP:
Renewal 3 EXP: John Adams Customer Care Devon Pless Nari Sadarangani

(512)581-5513 (800)824-6016 (864) 704-0510 (615)384-0573 
Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award connect@rubrix.com customercare@life-assist.com dpless@narescue.com Kentron@kentronmedical.com

Trauma Kits

Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewal
HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Opened: October 21, 2025

   K

$33.34ea Rescue Essentials 
Black Nylon Handles, Non-

Woven Fabric, 500Lbs Rated 
Item# 50-0457 Delivery ARO 

7-10 Days

$22.50ea Tri-Tech Forensics 
Recsue Essentials QuikLitter 
Lite, Black, 750lbs, 72"x27" 
Item# SW50469 Min order: 

$100 total Delivery ARO 2-7 
Days

$21.98ea North American 
Rescue QuikLitter Lite-BLK 
Itme# 60-0071 Min order: 1 

Delivery ARO 3-5 Days

$30.29 North American 
Rescue Item# 60-0071, 5 per 
case Min order: 5 Delivery 

ARO 15 Days

Quiklitter Lite (New Item) L 74in. X 
W 27in. Packaged: L 7 in. x W 6 in. x 
D 1.75 in Weight 12 oz Load rating: 
750 lb

mailto:connect@rubrix.com
mailto:customercare@life-assist.com
mailto:dpless@narescue.com
mailto:Kentron@kentronmedical.com
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 Initial

TC NUMBER: 2025-017

Initial Award: December 30, 2025 9:00AM EST.
Change Order #:
Renewal 1 EXP: 
Renewal 2 EXP:
Renewal 3 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award

A

B

C

Trauma Kits

Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewal
HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Opened: October 21, 2025

Trauma Response Bag (00622)

Tourniquet Combat Application 
(CAT), black in color (00614)

Quikclot Combat Gauze (00615)        
Quik Qlot combat gauze, z-folded 
3"x 4 yards. (Alternate brands not 
accepted)

HCSO Supplier SI-301110 HCSO Supplier SI- HCSO Supplier SI-301669

Bound Tree Medical School Health Corporation Edelwise Med Supply
5000 Tuttle Crossing Boulevard 5600 Apollo Drive 37 Easton Avenue Suite 200

Dublin, OH 43016 Rolling Meadows, Illinois 60008 New Brunswick, NJ 08901
United States of America United States of America United States of America

Rick Braun Order Processing Syed Navish
(800) 533-0523 (866)323-5465 (732)209-2165

rick.braun@boundtree.com orders@schoolhealth.com savish@edelwisems.com
customercare@boundtree.com

$55.00ea NcStar First 
Responder Utility Bag Black 

Item# CVFRB2918B
No Bid

$61.10ea NCSTAR Item# 
CVFRB2918B Min order: 5 

Delivery ARO 30 Days

$25.65 North American 
Rescue Item# 30-001, BTM 

Item# 1880-13022 

$31.02ea North American 
Rescue  Gen7 Combat 

Tourniquet, Black, Item# 
57780 Min order: 1 Delivery 

ARO 4-6 Days

$48.10ea TacMed Solutions 
Item# SOF-GEN5 Min order: 
5 Delivery ARO 7-10 Days

$36.49 BTM Item# G1284
$46.54ea Item# 55823 Min 
order: 1 Delivery ARO 4-6 

Days

$58.50 Item# 20-0079 Min 
order: 5 Delivery ARO 7-10 

Days

mailto:rick.braun@boundtree.com
mailto:orders@schoolhealth.com
mailto:savish@edelwisems.com
mailto:customercare@boundtree.com
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 Initial

TC NUMBER: 2025-017

Initial Award: December 30, 2025 9:00AM EST.
Change Order #:
Renewal 1 EXP: 
Renewal 2 EXP:
Renewal 3 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award

Trauma Kits

Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewal
HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Opened: October 21, 2025

   D

E

F

Hyfin Ven Twin Pack - Chest Seal 
(00617)  (Alternate brands not 
accepted)

Gauze - Non-sterile, 4"x4"(00619)

Emergency Trauma Dressing 
4"(02057)

HCSO Supplier SI-301110 HCSO Supplier SI- HCSO Supplier SI-301669

Bound Tree Medical School Health Corporation Edelwise Med Supply
5000 Tuttle Crossing Boulevard 5600 Apollo Drive 37 Easton Avenue Suite 200

Dublin, OH 43016 Rolling Meadows, Illinois 60008 New Brunswick, NJ 08901
United States of America United States of America United States of America

Rick Braun Order Processing Syed Navish
(800) 533-0523 (866)323-5465 (732)209-2165

rick.braun@boundtree.com orders@schoolhealth.com savish@edelwisems.com
customercare@boundtree.com

$14.49  BTM Item# NAR10-
0037 (for 1 pack of 2 each) 

2packs/case

$17.17ea Item# 1030510 Min 
order: 1 pack Delivery ARO 4-

6 Days

 $24.00ea Item# 10-0037 Min 
order: 5 Delivery ARO 7-10 

Days

$6.89ea North American 
Rescue brand BTM 
Item#1211-30093

$7.89ea North American 
Rescue Emergency Trauma 

Dressing, 4" Flat Min order: 1 
Delivery ARO 4-6 Days

$11.00ea Rescue Essentials 
Item# 40-1046 Min order: 5 

Delivery ARO 7-10 Days

$3.75pk Curaplex BTM 
Item# 1212-12113 (1 box of 

50 packs) 12 boxes/case

$3.91ea SH Brand Gauze 
Sponge Non-Adhesive 4-ply 

4x4 200 box Item# 27541, 10 
packs per case Min order: 1 
bag Delivery ARO 4-6 Days

 $13.00ea McKesson brand 
Item# 44802000 Min order: 5 

Delivery ARO 7-10 Days

mailto:rick.braun@boundtree.com
mailto:orders@schoolhealth.com
mailto:savish@edelwisems.com
mailto:customercare@boundtree.com
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 Initial

TC NUMBER: 2025-017

Initial Award: December 30, 2025 9:00AM EST.
Change Order #:
Renewal 1 EXP: 
Renewal 2 EXP:
Renewal 3 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award

Trauma Kits

Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewal
HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Opened: October 21, 2025

   G

H 

I

Trauma Shears (00620)

Mini Duct Tape (00618)

Gauze - NAR Wound Packing 3"x 
5yrd (02153)

HCSO Supplier SI-301110 HCSO Supplier SI- HCSO Supplier SI-301669

Bound Tree Medical School Health Corporation Edelwise Med Supply
5000 Tuttle Crossing Boulevard 5600 Apollo Drive 37 Easton Avenue Suite 200

Dublin, OH 43016 Rolling Meadows, Illinois 60008 New Brunswick, NJ 08901
United States of America United States of America United States of America

Rick Braun Order Processing Syed Navish
(800) 533-0523 (866)323-5465 (732)209-2165

rick.braun@boundtree.com orders@schoolhealth.com savish@edelwisems.com
customercare@boundtree.com

$3.00ea North American 
Rescue BTM Item# 600054-

kit
No Bid

$7.00ea North American 
Rescue Item# 30-0054 Min 
order: 5 Delivery ARO 7-10 

Days

$0.90ea Curaplex EMS 
Shears, Black 7.25in BTM 
Item# 2811-05524 200per 

case

$7.75ea Heavy Duty Utility 
Scissors, 7.5", black Fine 
Surgical Item# 36066 Min 

order: 1, Delivery ARO 4-6 
Days

$7.00ea McKesson brand 
Item# 320BMM Min order: 5 

Delivery ARO 7-10 Days

$1.65ea, 50 per case 
Safeguard Medical 

Item#CMRT-01 COMBAT 
Mekic Reinforcement Tape, 

2inx100in roll. BTM 
Item#1110-33801

No Bid
$4.00ea North American 

Rescue Min order: 5 Delivery 
ARO 7-10 Days

mailto:rick.braun@boundtree.com
mailto:orders@schoolhealth.com
mailto:savish@edelwisems.com
mailto:customercare@boundtree.com
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 Initial

TC NUMBER: 2025-017

Initial Award: December 30, 2025 9:00AM EST.
Change Order #:
Renewal 1 EXP: 
Renewal 2 EXP:
Renewal 3 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award

Trauma Kits

Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewal
HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Opened: October 21, 2025

   

J

1- Item C Quickclot Combat Gauze

1- Item D Hyfin Vent Chest Seal

1- Item E Emergency Trauma 
Dressing 4"

1- Item F Gauze -Non Sterile 4"x4" 
8ply 200ct

3- Item G Gauze - Wound Packing 
3"x5yrd

Trauma Response Kit (00613)

1- Item A: Carrying Bag

2- Item B Tourniquet Combat 
Application(CAT)

1- Item H Trauma Shears

1- Item I Mini Duct Tape

HCSO Supplier SI-301110 HCSO Supplier SI- HCSO Supplier SI-301669

Bound Tree Medical School Health Corporation Edelwise Med Supply
5000 Tuttle Crossing Boulevard 5600 Apollo Drive 37 Easton Avenue Suite 200

Dublin, OH 43016 Rolling Meadows, Illinois 60008 New Brunswick, NJ 08901
United States of America United States of America United States of America

Rick Braun Order Processing Syed Navish
(800) 533-0523 (866)323-5465 (732)209-2165

rick.braun@boundtree.com orders@schoolhealth.com savish@edelwisems.com
customercare@boundtree.com

No Bid

$202.42ea BTM Item# 
Custom-HCSO 12-16 weeks 
for initial build, 9-12 weeks 

after initial order

$295.00ea Scherber Basic 
First Responder Trauma Kit 

Fully Stocked Item# 
SCHTB200RK1 Min order: 1 

Delivery ARO 7-10 Days

mailto:rick.braun@boundtree.com
mailto:orders@schoolhealth.com
mailto:savish@edelwisems.com
mailto:customercare@boundtree.com
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 Initial

TC NUMBER: 2025-017

Initial Award: December 30, 2025 9:00AM EST.
Change Order #:
Renewal 1 EXP: 
Renewal 2 EXP:
Renewal 3 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award

Trauma Kits

Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewal
HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Opened: October 21, 2025

   K

Quiklitter Lite (New Item) L 74in. X 
W 27in. Packaged: L 7 in. x W 6 in. x 
D 1.75 in Weight 12 oz Load rating: 
750 lb

HCSO Supplier SI-301110 HCSO Supplier SI- HCSO Supplier SI-301669

Bound Tree Medical School Health Corporation Edelwise Med Supply
5000 Tuttle Crossing Boulevard 5600 Apollo Drive 37 Easton Avenue Suite 200

Dublin, OH 43016 Rolling Meadows, Illinois 60008 New Brunswick, NJ 08901
United States of America United States of America United States of America

Rick Braun Order Processing Syed Navish
(800) 533-0523 (866)323-5465 (732)209-2165

rick.braun@boundtree.com orders@schoolhealth.com savish@edelwisems.com
customercare@boundtree.com

$23.25ea Rescue Essentials 
Item# 50-0469 Transfer 

Device QuilLitter Lite, 27in x 
74in, 10 handle-holds, Load 

capacity 750lbs.

No Bid

$74.00ea NAR QuikLitter 
Lite Item# 60-0071 Min 

order: 1 Delivery ARO 7-10 
Days

mailto:rick.braun@boundtree.com
mailto:orders@schoolhealth.com
mailto:savish@edelwisems.com
mailto:customercare@boundtree.com
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 Initial

TC NUMBER: 2025-017

Initial Award: December 30, 2025 9:00AM EST.
Change Order #:
Renewal 1 EXP: 
Renewal 2 EXP:
Renewal 3 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award

A

B

C

Trauma Kits

Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewal
HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Opened: October 21, 2025

Trauma Response Bag (00622)

Tourniquet Combat Application 
(CAT), black in color (00614)

Quikclot Combat Gauze (00615)        
Quik Qlot combat gauze, z-folded 
3"x 4 yards. (Alternate brands not 
accepted)

HCSO Supplier SI-14672

Lawmen's and Shooters' Supply
701 Columbia Blvd
Titusville, FL 32780

United States of America

Orlando Rioseco
(321)360-3033

orioseco@lawmens.net

$58.80ea NcSTAR First 
Responder Utility Bag Item# 

CVFRB2918B 1 per case Min 
order: 1 Delivery ARO 5-7 Days

$28.80ea North American Rescue 
Item# 30-001 Combat Application 

Tourniquet Gen7 Min order: 1  
Delivery ARO 30 Days

$41.40ea Item# 30-0109 Min 
order: 1 Delivery ARO 30 Days

mailto:orioseco@lawmens.net
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 Initial

TC NUMBER: 2025-017

Initial Award: December 30, 2025 9:00AM EST.
Change Order #:
Renewal 1 EXP: 
Renewal 2 EXP:
Renewal 3 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award

Trauma Kits

Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewal
HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Opened: October 21, 2025

   D

E

F

Hyfin Ven Twin Pack - Chest Seal 
(00617)  (Alternate brands not 
accepted)

Gauze - Non-sterile, 4"x4"(00619)

Emergency Trauma Dressing 
4"(02057)

HCSO Supplier SI-14672

Lawmen's and Shooters' Supply
701 Columbia Blvd
Titusville, FL 32780

United States of America

Orlando Rioseco
(321)360-3033

orioseco@lawmens.net

$14.50ea Item# 10-0037 Min 
order: 1 Delivery ARO 30 Days

$7.25ea North American Rescue 
Emergency Trauma Dressing 

(ETD) 4in. Min order: 1  Delivery 
ARO 30 Days

$4.80ea North American Rescue 
Gauze 4"x4" Non-Sterile (pack of 
200) Item# 30-0157 Min order: 1 

Delivery ARO 30 Days

mailto:orioseco@lawmens.net
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 Initial

TC NUMBER: 2025-017

Initial Award: December 30, 2025 9:00AM EST.
Change Order #:
Renewal 1 EXP: 
Renewal 2 EXP:
Renewal 3 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award

Trauma Kits

Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewal
HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Opened: October 21, 2025

   G

H 

I

Trauma Shears (00620)

Mini Duct Tape (00618)

Gauze - NAR Wound Packing 3"x 
5yrd (02153)

HCSO Supplier SI-14672

Lawmen's and Shooters' Supply
701 Columbia Blvd
Titusville, FL 32780

United States of America

Orlando Rioseco
(321)360-3033

orioseco@lawmens.net

$3.88ea North American Rescue 
NAR Wound Packing 3"x5yrds 

Item# 30-0054 Min order: 1  
Delivery ARO 30 Days

$8.40ea Trauma Shears 7.25" 
Item# ZZ-0063 Min order: 1 

Delivery ARO 30 Days

$2.50ea North American Rescue 
Min order: 1 Delivery ARO 30 

Days

mailto:orioseco@lawmens.net
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 Initial

TC NUMBER: 2025-017

Initial Award: December 30, 2025 9:00AM EST.
Change Order #:
Renewal 1 EXP: 
Renewal 2 EXP:
Renewal 3 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award

Trauma Kits

Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewal
HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Opened: October 21, 2025

   

J

1- Item C Quickclot Combat Gauze

1- Item D Hyfin Vent Chest Seal

1- Item E Emergency Trauma 
Dressing 4"

1- Item F Gauze -Non Sterile 4"x4" 
8ply 200ct

3- Item G Gauze - Wound Packing 
3"x5yrd

Trauma Response Kit (00613)

1- Item A: Carrying Bag

2- Item B Tourniquet Combat 
Application(CAT)

1- Item H Trauma Shears

1- Item I Mini Duct Tape

HCSO Supplier SI-14672

Lawmen's and Shooters' Supply
701 Columbia Blvd
Titusville, FL 32780

United States of America

Orlando Rioseco
(321)360-3033

orioseco@lawmens.net

$205.00 North American Rescue 
Trauma Response Kit-Blk-HCSO 

Item# 85-0934 Min order: 1 
Delivery ARO 30 Days

mailto:orioseco@lawmens.net
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 Initial

TC NUMBER: 2025-017

Initial Award: December 30, 2025 9:00AM EST.
Change Order #:
Renewal 1 EXP: 
Renewal 2 EXP:
Renewal 3 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award

Trauma Kits

Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewal
HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Opened: October 21, 2025

   K

Quiklitter Lite (New Item) L 74in. X 
W 27in. Packaged: L 7 in. x W 6 in. x 
D 1.75 in Weight 12 oz Load rating: 
750 lb

HCSO Supplier SI-14672

Lawmen's and Shooters' Supply
701 Columbia Blvd
Titusville, FL 32780

United States of America

Orlando Rioseco
(321)360-3033

orioseco@lawmens.net

$26.40ea North American Rescue 
NAR Quicklitter Lite Blk Item# 
60-0071 Min order: 1 Delivery 

ARO 30 Days

mailto:orioseco@lawmens.net
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