Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office
P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

TABULATION

Stephanie Douglas, Buyer
sajack01@hcso.tampa.fl.us
813-247-0024

Bid Number: 9-18

Automotive Engine Replacement & Repair
Initial Term: One (1) year

Optional Renewals: Three (3) Annual
Opened: 3/1/2018

Awarded: 3/19/2018

Expires: 3/18/2019

1st Renewal expires:

2nd Renewal expires:

Zeigler Automotive, Inc.
601 US Alt. 19N
Palm Harbor, FL 34683

Jerry Slibert
PH: 813-891-6776

FX: 813-814-1074
Cell: 813-230-1988

Elite Auto & Tires Inc.
611 W. Robertson St.
Brandon, FL 33511

Shannon Long
PH: 813-689-7171

FX: 813-820-3334
Cell: 813-299-3065

Gator Ford Truck Sales Inc.

11780 Tampa Gateway Blvd
Seffner, FL 33584

Jeff Rieth
PH: 813-980-3673

FX: 813-261-1273
Cell: 813-924-9838

3rd Renewal expires: 8 j.silbert@live.com shannon@eliteautoand tires.com jrieth@gatorford.com
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD M Vendor # 249188 Vendor # 256845 Vendor # 13547
Line |Number of Bid Responses: 1 2 3
Item | Description of Item(s)
A |Engine Replacement (Long Block)
1 |Chevrolet Impala (2011-2016)-V6 3.5L & 3.8L LS $2,900.00 $3,805.00 No Bid
2 |Chevrolet Malibu (2006-Present)-6 Cyl. 3.5L & 36L |LS $2,900.00 $4,456.00 No Bid
3 |Chevrolet Suburban (2006-2013)-8 Cyl. 5.3L LS $3,750.00 $3,915.00 No Bid
4 |Chevrolet Tahoe (2010-2015)-8 Cyl. 4.8-5.3L LS $3,750.00 $3,915.00 No Bid
5 |Dodge 2500 & 3500 (2000-2002)-8 Cyl. 5.2L & 5.9L LS $2,850.00 $3,315.00 No Bid
6 |Dodge Caravan (2000-2014)-6 Cyl. 3.3-3.8L, V6 4.0L | LS $2,950.00 $3,750.00 No Bid
7 |Dodge Charger (2008-Present)-V6 3.5L & 3.6L LS $3,650.00 $4,884.00 No Bid
8 |Ford Crown Victoria (2007-2011)-V8 4.6L LS $2,500.00 $3,410.00 Cost plus 20%
9 |Ford E150, E250 & E350 (2009-Present)-V8 5.4L LS $3,450.00 $4,400.00 Cost plus 20%
10 |Ford Explorer (2016-Present)-V6 3.5-3.7L LS $2,350.00 $2,520.00 Cost plus 20%
11 |Ford F150 (2008-Present)-V6 4.2L, V8 4.6-5.0L LS $3,100.00 $3,925.00 Cost plus 20%
12 |Ford F250 & F350 (2008-Present)-V10 6.8L LS $3,650.00 $4,500.00 Cost plus 20%
13 |Ford Focus (2009-Present)-L4 2.0L LS $1,850.00. $3,450.00 Cost plus 20%
14 |Ford Fusion (2012-Present)-4 Cyl. 2.0L & 2.4L LS $1,950.00 $2,260.00 Cost plus 20%
15 |Ford Taurus (2007-Present)-V6 3.0L & 3.5L LS $2,500.00 $2,980.00 Cost plus 20%
16 |International Navistar (2004-Present)-Diesel DT466 LS No Bid $8,905.00 No Bid
17 |international Navistar (2004-Present)-Diesel T4443 LS No Bid $7,650.00 No Bid
B |Engine Head Gasket Repair
1 |Chevrolet Impala (2011-2016)-V6 3.5L & 3.8L LS $690.00 $975.00 No Bid
2 |Chevrolet Malibu (2006-Present)-6 Cyl. 3.5L & 3.6L LS $690.00 $975.00 No Bid
3 [Chevrolet Suburban (2006-2013)-8 Cyl. 5.3L LS $850.00 $975.00 No Bid
4 |Chevrolet Tahoe (2010-2015)-8 Cyl. 4.8-5.3L LS $850.00 $975.00 No Bid
5 [Dodge 2500 & 3500 (2000-2002)-8 Cyl. 5.2L & 5.9L LS $625.00 $725.00 No Bid
6 |Dodge Caravan (2000-2014)-6 Cyl. 3.3-3.8L, V6 4.0L |LS $575.00 $600.00 No Bid
7 |Dodge Charger (2008-Present)-V6 3.5L & 3.6L LS $675.00 $825.00 No Bid
8 |Ford Crown Victoria (2007-2011)-V8 4.6L LS $925.00 $925.00 Cost plus 20%
9 |Ford E150, E250 & E350 (2009-Present)-V8 5.4L LS $975.10 $1,475.00 Cost plus 20%
10 |Ford Explorer (2016-Present)-V6 3.5-3.7L LS $975.00 $1,550.00 Cost plus 20%
11 |Ford F150 (2008-Present)-V6 4.2L, V8 4.6-5.0L LS $925.00 $1,375.00 Cost plus 20%
12 |Ford F250 & F350 (2008-Present)-V10 6.8L LS $995.00 $725.00 Cost plus 20%
13 |Ford Focus (2009-Present)-L4 2.0L LS $595.00 $850.00 Cost plus 20%
14 |Ford Fusion (2012-Present)-4 Cyl. 2.0L & 2.4L LS $625.00 $900.00 Cost plus 20%
15 |Ford Taurus (2007-Present)-V6 3.0L & 3.5L LS $725.00 $1,050.00 Cost plus 20%
16 |International Navistar (2004-Present)-Diesel DT466 LS No Bid $1,600.00 No Bid
17 |International Navistar (2004-Present)-Diesel T4443 LS No Bid $1,850.00 No Bid
C |Parts Pricing (percentage off of list price) % 20 60 Dealer cost plus 20%
D |Fixed Hourly Labor Rate EA $45.00 $44.00 $92.50
E |Name of Parts & Labor Guide All Data Mitchell Ford Motor Company
F |warranty 3 Years 3 Years Unlimited See Bid Response
Exceptions N/A N/A See Bid Response
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