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Supply Distribution Bureau
Bryan Chandler, Buyer
(813) 247-8937
behandler@TeamHCSO.com

TC NUMBER: 7-20 Crime Scene & Fingerprint
Opened: October 29, 2020

Awarded: 12/10/2020 Expires: 12/9/2021
Change Order #:

Renewal 1 Expires: 12/9/2022
Renewal 2 Expires: 12/9/2023
Renewal 3 Expires: 12/9/2024

Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award,
Three (3) Optional Annual Renewals
(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

Arrowhead Forensics
11006 Strang Line Rd
Lenexa, KS 66215
(913) 945-1841

Brianna McCreary

bmccreary@arrowheadforensics.com

Sirchie Acqusition Company LLC
100 Hunter Place
Youngsville, NC 27596
(800) 356-7311

Dan O'Neil
bids@sirchie.com

The Peavey Corporation
11042 Strang Line Rd
Lenexa, KS 66215
(913) 495-6652

Greg Ebeling
gebeling@peaveycorp.com

DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS:

A. Fingerprint Brush — “Zephyr” fiberglass
filament fingerprint brush (11676)

A-2488
Cyclone Fingerprint Brush

1221
Sirchie Fiberglass Brush

1-0200

50 cs / No Min Order

No Min Order

Min Order 78 Brushes

collection, in hard plastic carrying case (10165)

C. Fingerprint Kit — Field kit for latent fingerprint

Custom Fingerprint Kit

$4.40 EA $4.25 EA $6.35 EA
. . A-2314W BPP09128 1-0013
B;ei;;ii:: ljztilrlgtzliﬂﬁgrnt“i(i)mdts;ni ,],3 ;ll: (’:kl 2?) 01;2:8 Black Latent Fingerprint Powder Sirchie Brand Silk Black Lighting Black Powder
y 116%8 g pow 6 cs / No Min Order No Min Order 2 - 128 oz Containers
( ) $59.74 EA $125.00 EA $85.00 EA
A-2206 176L N/A

Latent Finger Print Kit

25 ¢s / No Min Order

No Min Order

24 kits per cs / Min Order 48 Kits

$22.23 EA

$64.25 EA

$25.45 EA

non-fading, instantly drying, 0.5 ounce, 1 5/8”
diameter case (10367)

D. Fingerprint Pad — Stain-free ink, permanent and

A-2527P
1.5" Round Fingerprint Pad

PFP601
Flawless Ink Pad

30054
Black Magic Semi-Inkless

50 cs / No Min Order

No Min Order

Min Order 200 Pads

$6.15 EA

$4.25 EA

$5.22 EA

E. Fingerprint Ink Remover Towelettes — 100
towelettes per box (10549)

A-2515
Ink Remover Toweletts

FPTIC
Super Cleaner Towelettes (bx 100)

05580

10 bx / Min Order 1 bx

Min Order 1 bx

1 bx (1000 ca)

H. Crime Scene Tape — Yellow / Black, 3” tape
with 2” lettering “Sheriff’s Line — Do Not Cross”,
1000 roll (10783)

$10.30 EA/Box of 100 $8.35 EA / box of 100 $0.125 EA or 12.50 / per box of 100
. L . o 144L 05563
F. Fingerprint Lifting Tape — Clear lift tape, 1 /2” x|  1.5"x360" Clear Tape, price per roll Trasparent Lift Tape
360” roll in plastic container / jar (10785) 100 Rolls / No Min Order No Min Order Min Order 100
$4.18 EA $3.50 EA $3.34 EA
A-2103 14512 05564
G. Fingerprint Lifting Tape — Frosted lift tape, 2” x 2"x360" Clear Tape, price per roll Transparent Life Tape Lifting Tape in Plastic Bag
360" roll in plastic container / jar (11777) 100 Rolls / No Min Order No Min Order Min Order 40
$5.57 EA $6.00 EA $3.95 EA
A-6102 BT300 56175

CSDNC Yellow w/black print

30 cs / No Min Order

No Min Order

8 rl per cs / Min Order 144 1l

$11.61 EA $11.00 EA $9.30 EA
I. Plastic Evidence Container — 1” x 8” squared . b . ECT2 NO BID
. . . Evidence Tube Hexagon Cap Syringe Transport Tube
syringe transport tube, clear with biohazard - -
ki 0.032” wall thick (min) (10580) 12 pk / Min Order 1 pk 12 pk / Min Order 1 pk
markings, 0. wall thickness (min $17.92 PK $18.00 PK
J. Plastic Evidence Container — 3” x 12” evidence . A_} 2 E(?TS NO BID
R . R . Tube with Biohazard Label Collection Tube
collection tube, clear with biohazard markings, = .
0.035” wall thick . 10529) 8 pk / Min Order 1 pk 8 pk / Min Order 1 pk
0357 wall thickness (min) ( $33.55 PK. $30.00 PK
K. Blank Manila Tags w/Strings NO BID NO BID NO BID
512"X25/8"
L. Water Resistant Shoe Covers, size range 6-15 NO BID . SE0073 . . 79751 o
( item)Water Resistant Shoe C . Disposable Shoe Covers (1 pair) Up to size 12 (limited availability)
new ttem)water p elssls an .toe OVers, S1ze range Min Order 1 pr 400 cs / Min Order 400
15 (new item) $2.00 PR $1.45 EA
A-'1007-15 ETIOO i 05673
M. Nylon Natural Cable Ti 147, 401b Tensile Strength Nylon Evidence Ties
- IVylon Ratural t-able fies = 14, 100 pk / Min Order 1 pk 100 pk / Min Order I pk 1000 cs / Min Order 500
$14.60 PK $11.50 PK $0.058 EA
A-31218-C SM60002 N/A
N. Evidence Tape, Red, 108" Roll (10784) Custom Print 1-3/8"x108" Dispenser Custom Imprint
with white, write on strip, in dispenser box 51 rollscs / 12 rolls Min Order 25 rolls 105 cs / Min Order 420
$6.90 EA $8.00 EA $8.90 EA
Business Days to Delivery ARO 10-14 Business Days 7-14 Days 5-30 Days

Award Notes

A. Fingerprint Brush — “Zephyr” fiberglass
filament fingerprint brush (11676)

one item.

After a review of the awarded line items, it was identified that Sirchie was to be awarded only a single item. It was
determined that based on the estimated annual cost impact of $3.00, it was not cost effective to manage a supplier for the

D. Fingerprint Pad — Stain-free ink, permanent and
non-fading, instantly drying, 0.5 ounce, 1 5/8”
diameter case (10367)

cost, as the size differences were not material.

Each of the suppliers offered different size cases. It was determined for this item, to select item the item with the lowest

M. Nylon Natural Cable Ties — 14”, 401b

specifications

Each of the suppliers offered different size cable ties. It was determined for this item, to select item that met the
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