



BID NUMBER: 2026-018 Shredding Services Opened: 8/12/2026 @ 15:00 EST Initial Award Date: September 1, 2026 Initial Award Time: 3:00 PM EST Initial EXP: 9/1/2028 Renewal 1 EXP: 9/1/2029 Renewal 2 EXP: 9/1/2030 Renewal 3 EXP: 9/1/2031 Terms: Two (2) Year Initial Award Optional: Three (3) Annual Renewals		HCSO Supplier SI-301958 A1 SHREDDING & RECYCLING 1775 West Oak Parkway, Suite 500 Marietta, GA 30062 Tim Smith (770) 795-9744 service@a1shreds.com	HCSO Supplier SI-301801 C2 INCORPORATED DBA SHRED360 19046 Bruce B Downs Blvd, Suite 154 Tampa, FL 33647 Brenda Goodwin (813) 944-2223 brenda@shred360.com	HCSO Supplier SI-301957 DATA-STRUCTION, INC. 3532 Hampton Road Oceanside, NY 11572 Joe Tarulli (813) 515-0827 sales@data-struction.com
HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD				
A	Physical Media Destruction (CD/DVD, Film, and Other Optical Media, Magnetic Media, and Flash Memory)	\$20.00 per box up to 24"	Pricing based on media type, qty and whether destruction is on or off site. Pricing will be provided based on project requirements.	\$3.84* per box up to 24" (Please see exceptions for more information)
B	File Box (Up To 24")	\$7.00 per box up to 24"	See recurring service pricing below by bin size and service frequency.	\$24.95* per box up to 24"
C	Small Console Bin	Weekly	\$40.00	\$3.45*
		Bi-Weekly	\$45.00	\$3.45*
		Monthly	\$45.00	\$3.45*
		Bi-Monthly	\$55.00	\$3.45*
		Quarterly	\$75.00	\$3.45*
		Extra Pickup	NO BID	\$3.45*
D	32 Gallon Bin	Weekly	\$40.00	\$8.95*
		Bi-Weekly	\$45.00	\$8.95*
		Monthly	\$45.00	\$8.95*
		Bi-Monthly	\$55.00	\$8.95*
		Quarterly	\$75.00	\$8.95*
		Extra Pickup	NO BID	\$8.95*
E	64 Gallon Bin	Weekly	\$49.00	\$18.45*
		Bi-Weekly	\$54.00	\$18.45*
		Monthly	\$54.00	\$18.45*
		Bi-Monthly	\$64.00	\$18.45*
		Quarterly	\$84.00	\$18.45*
		Extra Pickup	NO BID	\$18.45*
F	96 Gallon Bin	Weekly	\$49.00	\$24.95*
		Bi-Weekly	\$54.00	\$24.95*
		Monthly	\$54.00	\$24.95*
		Bi-Monthly	\$64.00	\$24.95*
		Quarterly	\$84.00	\$24.95*
		Extra Pickup	NO BID	\$24.95*
G	Orient Road Jail 96 Gallon Bins (10 Bin Estimate)	Drop Off	\$200.00	\$175.00*
		Per Tip/Dump	\$50.00	\$24.95
		Pick-up	\$200.00	\$175.00*
	Exceptions			Hard Drives are destroyed at \$6.50 per drive. Flash Drives are \$1.75 per drive. *\$30 destination fee applies to each service per area (location)