Supply Distribution Bureau
Danielle Joseph, Buyer
(813) 247-8968

SHERIFF’S OFFICE

BID TABULATION - page 1 of 3

BID 7-17 “Casual” Uniform Items DESIGN LAB, INC YOUNG GUNS B & B SPORTS SALES
Opened: July 12, 2017 1911 N. US Hwy 301, suite 150 143 Scarlet Blvd 6109 N. Nebraska Ave.
Awarded: September 2, 2017 Tampa, FL 33619 Oldsmar, FL 34677 Tampa, FL 33604
Expires: September 1, 2020 Ph: 813-234-2100 Ph: 813-814-9172 Ph: 813-238-2542
Renewal 1 EXP: September 1, 2021
Renewal 2 EXP: September 1, 2022
Renewal 3 EXP: September 1, 2023 Orders: Matt Moller John Skiadas John Madsen
Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award mattpmoller@yahoo.com yg4apparel@gmail.com john.madsen@rjadvertising.net
Three (3) Annual Renewals Bid Contact: David Shaheen yonski2u@aol.com
(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)
Item #: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS: 1 2 3
Customization Options (ADD to Base): Polos: Oxfords: || Jackets: Polos: Oxfords: Jackets: Polos: Oxfords: || Jackets:
HCSO Civilian Logo on left chest* $2.00 $2.00 $2.00 $4.51 $4.51 $4.51 $5.00 $5.00 $5.00
CPID Logo on left chest $6.00 $6.00 $6.00 $5.57 $5.57 $5.57 $6.00 $6.00 $6.00
HCSO Star w/ lines on left chest $4.00 $4.00 $4.00 $4.77 $4.77 $4.77 $5.50 $5.50 $5.50
HCSO Star w/ title in rocker on left chest $4.00 $4.00 $4.00 $5.30 $5.30 $5.30 $6.00 $6.00 $6.00
One line on right chest $4.00 $4.00 N/A $3.18 $3.00 N/A $4.00 $4.00 N/A
Two lines on right chest $5.00 $5.00 N/A $4.24 $4.00 N/A $5.50 $5.50 N/A
"SHERIFF" heat press across upper back $7.00 N/A N/A $7.42 N/A N/A $6.00 N/A N/A
"FORENSICS" heat press across upper back $7.00 N/A N/A $7.42 N/A N/A $6.00 N/A N/A
*Size up charge - 2XL $2.00 $3.00 $3.00 $2.12 $2.12 $2.12 $2.00 $2.00 $3.00
*Size up charge - 3XL $4.00 $4.00 $4.00 $3.18 $3.18 $3.18 $3.00 $3.00 $4.00
*Size up charge - 4XL $5.00 $6.00 $5.00 $4.24 $4.24 $4.24 $4.00 $4.00 $5.00
Polo Shirts (Base Price):
1) Blue Generation BG7224 - men's $14.74 $14.18 $14.50
2) Blue Generation BG6224 - ladies $14.74 $14.18 $14.50
3) Port Authority K500LS - men's $14.74 $13.50 $13.60
4) Port Authority L500LS - ladies $14.74 $13.50 $13.60
5) CornerStone CS410 - men's $20.94 $19.95 $20.75
6) CornerStone CS411 - ladies $20.94 $19.95 $20.75
Oxford Shirts (Base Price):
1) Harriton M500S - unisex short sleeve $15.36 $17.11 $15.00
2) Harriton M500 - men's long sleeve $15.36 $17.11 $15.00
3) Harriton M500W - ladies long sleeve $15.36 $17.11 $15.00
Jackets (Base Price):
1) Micro Fleece Jacket Opt 1: Team 365 / #TT90 $18.49 $20.70 Team 365 men's #TT90 / Team 365 / #TT90
2) Medical Scrub Jacket Landau / #7551 Sivvan / #S8306 All Heart / #G102
3) Port Authority Northwest Slicker #J7710 / Black
Dri-Fit T-Shirt
(2X-3X) $7.89 (2X-3X) $7.20, $8.20
1\ DFLEj it with-Sheriff s Long Sleeve (S-XL) $7.97 Shert-Sleeve $9.60 Long Sleeve (S-XL) $7.65
(2X-3X) $8.97 Long-Sleeve $14-15 (2X-3X) $8.65, $9.65
23 Dri Fit t-shirtfor Cadets (2X-3X) $7.89 Short Sleeve-$11-08 (2X-3X) $8.25, $9.25
Long Sleeve (S-XL) $7.97 Long-Sleeve $12.60 Long Sleeve (S-XL) $9.00
Time for Delivery ARO 14 Business Days 14 - 21 Business Days 30 Calendar Day
Shipping Fee Included Included Included
Exceptions NONE NONE NONE

CO#1 - Add Women's Micro Fleece Jacket

CO#2 - Price for Civilian Logo increased by $.25.
CO#3 - Add Port Authority Northwest Slicker

CO#4 - Add Dri-Fit t-shirt

CO#5 - Add Burgundy Color Shirt - Blue Generation



SHERIFF’S OFFICE
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Supply Distribution Bureau
Danielle Joseph, Buyer
(813) 247-8968

BID 7-17 “Casual” Uniform ltems

Opened: July 12, 2017

Awarded: September 2, 2017

Expires: September 1, 2021

Renewal 1 EXP:

Renewal 2 EXP:

Renewal 3 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award

Three (3) Annual Renewals
(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

FAST LANE CLOTHING CO.
5112 N. 22nd St.
Tampa, FL 33610
Ph: 813-879-3298

Juan Davis
juan@fastlaneclothing.com

ALLEGRA MARKETING
2705 N. Falkenberg Rd
Tampa, FL 33619
Ph: 813-664-1129

Kinda Manci
Linda@allegratampa.com

TANNER'S INC
1005 E. Brandon Blvd
Brandon, FL 33511
Ph: 813-689-4920

Mike Tanner
mike@tannersinc.net

Jackets (Base Price):

Team 365/ #TT90

—hH-Miero-Fleece-Jacket $22.00
2\ MedicalS Landau / #3507
$23.00

—H-Dri-Fitt-shirtwith-Sheriffand-Star NO BID
—2)-Dri-Fitt-shirtfor Cadets NO BID
Time for Delivery ARO 14 Business Days
Shipping Fee Included
Exceptions NONE

Item #: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS: 4 5 6
Customization Options (ADD to Base): Polos: || Oxfords: || Jackets:
HCSO Civilian Logo on left chest $6.00 $6.00 $6.00
CPID Logo on left chest $8.00 $8.00 $8.00
HCSO Star w/ lines on left chest $8.00 $8.00 $8.00
HCSO Star w/ title in rocker on left chest $8.50 $8.50 $8.50
One line on right chest $4.50 $4.50 N/A
Two lines on right chest $8.50 $8.50 N/A
"SHERIFF" heat press across upper back $9.00 N/A N/A
"FORENSICS" heat press across upper back $9.00 N/A N/A
Size up charge - 2XL $2.00 $2.00 $2.00
Size up charge - 3XL $3.00 $3.00 $3.00
Size up charge - 4XL $4.00 $4.00 $4.00
Polo Shirts (Base Price):

1) Blue Generation BG7224 $15.75

2) Blue Generation BG6224 $15.75

3) Port Authority K500LS $14.65 NO BID NO BID

4) Port Authority L500LS $14.65

5) CornerStone CS410 $20.00

6) CornerStone CS411 $20.00

Oxford Shirts (Base Price):

1) Harriton M500S $14.50

2) Harriton M500 $14.50

3) Harriton M500W $14.50
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BID 7-17 “Casual” Uniform Items

Opened: July 12, 2017

Awarded: September 2, 2017

Expires: September 1, 2021

Renewal 1 EXP:

Renewal 2 EXP:

Renewal 3 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award

Three (3) Annual Renewals
(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

Lowegos and Beyond, LLC
Ph: 230-8017

Beverly Lowe
lowegos@verizon.net

Item #: DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS:

Customization Options (ADD to Base):

HCSO Civilian Logo on left chest

CPID Logo on left chest

HCSO Star w/ lines on left chest

HCSO Star w/ title in rocker on left chest

One line on right chest

Two lines on right chest

"SHERIFF" heat press across upper back

"FORENSICS" heat press across upper back

Size up charge - 2XL

Size up charge - 3XL

Size up charge - 4XL

Polo Shirts (Base Price):

1) Blue Generation BG7224

2) Blue Generation BG6224

3) Port Authority K500LS

4) Port Authority L500LS

5) CornerStone CS410

)
)
)
)
)
)

6) CornerStone CS411

Oxford Shirts (Base Price):

1) Harriton M500S

2) Harriton M500

3) Harriton M500W

Jackets (Base Price):

—1)—Micro-Fleece Jacket

—2)Medical-Serub-Jacket
DriEj irt with-Sherift S

>y Dri Bt et for C

[Time for Delivery ARO

Shipping Fee

Exceptions

NO BID

Supply Distribution Bureau
Danielle Joseph, Buyer
(813) 247-8968



