P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office

QUOTATION TABULATION

-Pagelof1l

Purchasing Unit
Carly Cartwright, Buyer
(813) 247-0026

QUOTE NUMBER:

BID 23-16: DUTY GEAR
Opened: August 5, 2016
Awarded: August 19, 2016
1St Renewal:

Terms: One Year Initial Award
Three (3) Annual Renewals
(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

Galls
1340 Russell Cave Rd.
Lexington, KY 40505
Ph: 800-876-4242 ext 2175
Fx: 877-914-2557

Donnie Gillespie
gellespie-donnie@galls.com

Dana Safety Supply
3810-A W. Hillsborough Ave.
Tampa, FL 33614
Ph: 813-348-4866
Fx: 813-375-8347

Mark Sevigny
msevigny@1dss.com

Lawmen's & Shooters Supply
7750 9™ Street SW
Vero Beach, FL 32968
Ph: 800-562-5697
Fx: 772-569-2955

Gail Walker-Keen
bids@lawmans.net

Law Enforcement Supply

5011-H W. Hillsborough Ave.

Tampa, FL 33634
Ph: 800-522-8949 ext 4313
Fx: 813-855-7787

Daniel Hunter
dhunter@lawsupply.com

GT Distributors, Inc.

100 McFarland Ave.

Rossville, GA 30741
Ph: 706-866-2764
Fx: 706-861-4444

Sandi White
sandie.white@gtdist.com

Item #: |DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS: 1 2 3 4 5
HI GLOSS GEAR:

Hi Gloss Glove Pouch

10972 Safariland 33-9V NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.10 $12.42
Hi Gloss Radio Holder

10973 Dutyman 4131 $18.30 $15.50 $18.49 NO BID $15.22
Hi Gloss Radio Holder (alternate)

10973 Safariland 763-9 NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.05 $19.19
Hi Gloss Belt Keepers

10974 Safariland 62-4-9HS NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.05 $14.27
Hi Gloss Cuff Case

10975 Safariland 190-9HS NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.80 $22.64
Hi Gloss OC Foam Holder

10977 Safariland 38-4-9-HS NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.05 $19.19
Hi Gloss Double Mag Holder

11378 Safariland 77-76-9HS NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.25 $24.84

Various |Hi Gloss Belt NO BID NO BID NO BID $50.58 $46.37
Hi Gloss FNS-9 Holster RH Mid-Ride w/o

11710 light - Safariland 6360-269-491 NO BID NO BID NO BID $133.60 $87.31
Hi Gloss FNS-9 Holster LH Mid-Ride w/o

11711 light - Safariland 6360-269-492 NO BID NO BID NO BID $133.60 $87.31
Hi Gloss FNS-9 Holster RH Low-Ride w/o

11712 light - Safariland 6365-269-491 NO BID NO BID NO BID $133.60 $87.31
Hi Gloss FNS-9 Holster LH Low-Ride - w/o

11713 light - Safariland 6365-269-492 NO BID NO BID NO BID $133.60 $87.31

PADDLE HOLSTERS:

FNS-9 ALS Concealment Holster RH w/

11722 Guard - Safariland 6378-266-411-AG NO BID NO BID NO BID $44.50 $30.23
FNS-9 ALS Concealment Holster LH w/

11723 Guard - Safariland 6378-266-412-AG NO BID NO BID NO BID $44.50 $30.23
FNS-9 GLS Pro-Fit Holster RH w/ Light -

11724 Safariland 578-283-411 NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.25 $29.69
FNS-9 GLS Pro-Fit Holster LH w/ Light -

11725 Safariland 578-283-412 NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.25 $26.69
Business Days for Delivery ARO 10-14 Days 30 Days 30-45 Days 21-30 Days 21 Days
Samples Received with Bid Package N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
EXCEPTIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE
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