P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office

QUOTATION TABULATION - Page 1 of 3

Purchasing Section
Jennifer Miller, Buyer
(813) 247-8068

QUOTE NUMBER: |
16-15 Trauma Kits North American Rescue, LLC Lighthouse for the Blind Bound Tree Medicat, LLC Nashville Medical &
35 Tedwall Court 10440 Trenton Ave. 5000 Tittle Crossing Bivd. EMS Products
|Opened: May 29, 2015 Greer, SC 29650 St. Louis, MO 63132 Dublin, OH 43016 P.O. Box 64
Springfield, TN 37172
Awarded: July 9, 2015 Brent Bronson / Susan Horton |2 |John Caine 2 [Jason stieler 2 |Nari Sadarangani 2
Ph: 864-675-9800 £ |Ph: 314-423-4333 ext 104 £ |Ph: 800-533-0523 £ |Ph: 615-384-0573 £
Terms: One Year Initial Award Fx: 864-675-9880 £ |Fx: 314-423-0139 % Fx: 877-311-2437 2 |Fx: 615-668-1147 2
Three (3) Annual Renewals 8 licaine@!hbindustries.com | § |jstieler@boundtree.com g nashvilleems@gmail.com g
(YELLOW AREA INDICATES AWARD) ] @ ] o
DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS: A B C D
item #22-9000 Fox Outdoors #123, 124, 125 Item #96-PX-1010 Item #CVFRB2918G
A) Carrying Bag $24.99 Y $54.00 {N $11.75 N $39.99 Y
Item #30-0001 TacMed Solutions SOFFTT- Item #1880-13022 Item #30-0001
|B) Combat Application Tourniquet (CAT) $2352 Y. NH $31.08 N $26.25 Y $26.99 A
ftem #30-0039 QuikClot Combat Gauze #200 ltem #1214-10016 Item #350
C) QuikClot Combat Gauze - $3495 Y, $34.14 Y $27.85 N $36.99 Y,
Item #30-0042 Persys Israeli bandage Item #279-3503EA Item #IBFF01-HHMEDICAL
D) H-Bandage Compression Bandage W, $8.45 Ye #FCP-03  $7.38 N $0.16 N $6.49 Y
Item #10-0037 Combat Med Systems Item #NAR10-0029 [tem #10-0037
E) HyFin Vented Chest Seals {2-pk) $10.94 Y #20-001 $21.44 N $15.98 $12.99
. ) ltem #22.0084 CMRTO1 Item #151527SEA NSN 6510-01-549-0927
|F) H&H Combat Medic Reinforcement Tape  s140 $1.65 Y $0.35 $1.75 Y
. . Item #30-0095 Tactical QuikClot #2064-0291 ltem #1214-47344EA ZMEDICA 473 (3 per bag)
|G) QuikClot 4x4 Dressings $8.99 Y $38.11 $8.53 Y $25.49 Y
Itern #22-0113 Dynarex #3354 Item #F165622EA KENTRON 448111-50
IH) Gauz Gt (pkiofioh) 3080 $0.05 $0.59 $0.79
» Item #22-0063 #STS ltem #51410 KENTRON KI141-05
l') IiSHmatStsarsioS $6.60 N $4.61 i $0.70 I $0.89 K
. Item #22-9001 MDQ 80201 Unifirst Item #065-000252108HW KENTRON 809920
J) CPR Mouth Barrier $4 .99 Y $7.26 \¥2 $3.75 $1.49 N
. N lem #85-0034 HillsTraumaK Item #96PX1010-KIT KENTRON 223311T
EK) Assembled Kit of all above items A-J i 4108 75 $199.72 $99.83 $177.69
Items A,K: 20 days items A, |, K (initial): 60 days A - .
|Business Days to Delivery ARO Items B, C, D, E, F, I: 5 days temsB,C,D, E, F, G, H, J All kems: ;?.;:: ey sk 't:;":: gt‘i Zvdvaefks
Items G, H, J: 10 days 30 days '
oy Alternate Items for A, B, D, E
IEXCEPTIONS Item | Is larger 7 1/4” size (specs / info provided) None




P.O. Box 3371
Tampa, FL 33601

Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office

QUOTATION TABULATION - Page 2 of 3

Purchasing Section
Jennifer Miller, Buyer
(813) 247-8068

QUOTE NUMBER:
16-15 Trauma Kits

Products Unlimited, chc

Henry Schein EMS

Rescue Essentials

Law Enforcement Supply

P.O. Box 339 P.O. Box 3227 P.O. Box 987
Opened: May 29, 2015 Justin, TX 76247 Irmo, SC 29063 Salida, CO 81201
Awarded: July 9, 2015 Janey Cooper 2 |Alan Espinosa 2 [Betty Davis 3 |Daniel Hunter 2
Ph: 800-865-4683 ext 109 £ |Ph: 800-845-3550 £ [Ph: 719-539-4843 £ [Ph: 800-522-8949 ext 4313 €
Terms: One Year Initial Award Fx: 940-648-3407 2 |Fx: 800-533-4793 2 [Fx: 866-710-4356 £ 2
Three (3) Annual Renewals licooper@ g § |pety@ ’g dhunter@lawsupply.com g
(YELLOW AREA INDICATES AWARD) products-unlimited.com @ 1] rescue-essentials.com N M
DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS: E F G H
NcStar CVFRB2918G No Bid Item #70-0445
A) Carrying Bag $22.00 Y ° $29.44 N NO BID
J Item #30-0001 Item #30-0001 Item #20-0080
B) Combat Application Toumiquet (CAT) $24.75 Y $23.87 Y $26.25 Y
I Zmedica QuikClot #350 Item #30-0109 Item #20-0073
C) QuikClot Combat Gauze $33.00 Y $44.20 $37.53 Y
Item #HBO1 Item #HS05142 Item #40-0290
D) H-Bandage Compression Bandage $6.06 Y $19.00 $6.34 Y
Item #10-0037 Item #10-0029 Item #50-0119
E) HyFin Vented Chest Seals (2-pk) $11.85 Y $8.69 $12.40
F) H&H Combat Medic Reinforcement Tape HEH :f;’gRTm Y No Bid Item:f g61200
. . Zmedica #473 Item #Zmedica 473 Item #20-0078
G) QuikClot 4x4 Dressings $23.95 Y $33.90 Y $26.24 Y
NDC #P159544 Item #3242 Item #30-1086
'”) i il $2.275 (pack of 200) N $3.78 $2.29
W ADC #321BK Item #321BK-ADC Item #50-0660
II) Trauma Shears 5.5 $2.75 N $3.00 $1.06 Y
) ltem #4921 Dynarex . Item #50-0175
J) CPR Mouth Barrier $1.18 N No Bid $3.70 N
. . CUSTOMKIT . Item # "Misc Kit"
|K) Assembled Kit of all above items A-J $143.96 No Bid $149.24

Business Days to Delivery ARO

Item A: 5-7 days;ltem B, E: 7
days; Item C: 7-10 days; Item D:
21 days; tem F, G: 10 days; Item
H: 14 days; item I: 20 days; Item

J: 14 days; Item K: 30-45 days

All items bid: 3 days

Items A-J: 30 days

Item K: 45 days

IEXC EPTIONS

Item | is larger 7 1/2" size

None

Alternate items for A and

J (sample)




) Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office Purchasing Section
P.O. Box 3371 Jennifer Miller, Buyer
Tampa, FL 33601 (813) 247-8068

QUOTATION TABULATION - Page 3 of 3

QUOTE NUMBER.
16-15 Trauma Kits Staples, Inc. McKesson Medical-Surgical N/A N/A

Opened: May 29, 2015

Chris Zemien-Martin
Ph: 800-328-8111

Awarded: July 9, 2015 Jonathan Mylett

Ph: 941-812-6717
Terms: One Year Initial Award
Three (3) Annual Renawals jonathan.mylett@staples.com
(YELLOW AREA INDICATES AWARD)

Exact Item Bid
Exact Item Bid
|Exact Iltem Bid

Exact ltem Bid

IDESCRIPTION OF ITEMS: | J

|A) Carrying Bag NO BID NO BID

{B) Combat Application Tourniquet (CAT)

|c) QuikClot Combat Gauze

ID} H-Bandage Compression Bandage

IE) HyFin Vented Chest Seals (2-pk)

|F) H&H Combat Medic Reinforcement Tape

IG) QuikClot 4x4 Dressings

[H) Gauze Pads (pk of 50)

J1) Trauma Shears 5.5"

JY) CPR Mouth Barrier

IK) Assembled Kit of all above items A-J

Business Days to Delivery ARO

|EXCEPTIONS




