
Initial Award

BID NUMBER: 2024-001

Initial Award:  January 18, 2024

A
B
C
D
E
F
G
H
I
J
K
L
M
N
O
P
Q
R

Price Est. Time for 
Completion Price Est. Time for 

Completion Price Est. Time for 
Completion Price Est. Time for 

Completion Price Est. Time for 
Completion Price Est. Time for 

Completion 

S $150 each 2 hours $150 each 2 hours $200 each 20-25 
vehicles/day

T $150 each 2 hours $150 each 2 hours $200 each 20-25 
vehicles/day

U $165 each 2 hours $200 each 2 hours
V $95 each 1.5 hours $100 each 1 hour
W $175 each 2 hours $200 each 2.5 hours
X $650 each 1 day $250 each 3-4 hours
Y $60 each per panel N/A

Z Flat - $10/sf
Curved - $12/sf

per project
per project $75/hour per project $10-$15/sf per project

AA
Lines S-X

cost
+ $75/each

Lines S-X
Est. Time
+ 1 hour

$95/hour per project

BB $85/hour per project $98/hr on-site
$125/hr off-site 6-12 days

CC Removal 
Labor $75/hour per project $95/hour per project $98/hour 6-12 days

Exceptions: 

Notes: 

Motorcycle 
Van with Utility Body
Boat - 36 feet 

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES 

Opened: December 20, 2023

SUV (bulk order of 20 sets)
SUV
Truck (bulk order of 20 sets)
Truck

tintpluspc@gmail.com

Art Designed/Tint Plus, Inc.
2711 Airport Road, Ste. 2

Plant City, FL 33563

Gina Kline

Custom Vehicle Decal Services

Change Order #:
Auto Renewal 1 EXP:  January 17, 2028
Auto Renewal 2 EXP:  January 17, 2030
Auto Renewal 3 EXP:  January 17, 2032

Terms: Two (2) Year Initial Award 
Optional: Three (3) ea  two (2) Year Renewals

Transportation Van 

Design Decal and Production

$202.85 per set No Bid per set *

$4,057.00 per 20 sets No Bid per 20 sets *
$202.85 per set No Bid per set *

Trailer - 20 feet or more
$650.00 per set No Bid per set *

per set No Bid per set *

Trailer - less than 20 feet
$650.00 per set No Bid per set * per set

per set 

*
per set No Bid per set *

No Bid$4,057.00 per 20 sets

Boat - 40 feet 
$600.00 

$95.00 per set No Bid per set *
$225.00

$2.00 each No Bid each * each

* per set

HCSO Start - 4 inch
$1.00 each No Bid each * eachHCSO Star - 3 inch

$850.00 per set No Bid per set

HCSO Star - 5 inch 
$1.50 each No Bid

Custom Design Services

* each

Sheriff - Front License Plate
$1.50 each No Bid each * eachAmerican Flag - 4x6 inches

HCSO Star - 25 inch

* each

per 20 sets

each

each
hourNo Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

* eacheach

per set

per set

Vans No Bid No Bid * *

SUVs No Bid * *

Trucks No Bid * *

Vans with Utility Body No Bid No Bid * *
Motorcycles No Bid No Bid * *

*
Decal Repair No Bid * *
Boats No Bid No Bid *

NONE 

Application Labor No Bid No BidN/A

Decal Removal with
Glue/Adhesive removal N/A *N/A

*

* hour

per set 
per set

N/A

$202.85

each

each
hour$85.00 

$15.00

$20.00

Decal Application per Vehicle Decal Removal per Vehicle Decal Application per Vehicle Decal Removal per Vehicle Decal Application per Vehicle Decal Removal per Vehicle

per set 

Vehicle Wraps
Flat Surface/Curved Surface * *

Tampa, FL 33619
1421 Massaro Blvd.

Redline Design, LLC

sales@redlinedesign.tv

Cell: (703) 615-2283
Office: (813) 315-8403

per set
per set
per 20 sets
per set
per 20 sets

SI-300907SI-259374SI-255727

Office:  (813) 719-8780
Cell:  (813) 763-3749

NONE
Need to see vehicles to give accurate price on vans/ motorcycles and 

other vehicles

* Due to the creative process and the wide variation in the quality of art files 
and decal design needs, modification and change requests, calculating a set 

time and dollar amount for professional graphic design services is not 
practical. 

NONE

NONE 

*N/A

No Bid

*

No Bid

*

James Kiernan

Clearwater, FL 33762
4400 140th Ave. N., Ste. 250
Sign-Age of Tampa Bay, Inc.

jkiernan@sign-age.com

Cell:  (727) 420-8539
Office:  (727) 536-9400 x17

Justin Good 
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