Tampa, FL 33601

Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office
P.O. Box 3371

TABULATION

Stephanie Douglas, Buyer
sajack01@hcso.tampa.fl.us

813-247-0024

Bid Number: 12-17

Bulk Fuel: Gasoline and Diesel

Initial Term: One (1) year

Optional Renewals: Three (3) Annual
Opened: 6/23/2017

Awarded: 9/1/2017

Expires: 8/31/2018

1st Renewal expires:

2nd Renewal expires:

J. H. Williams Oil Company,
Inc.
1237 East Twiggs Street
Tampa, FL 33602

Larry McGary
PH: 941-201-3557

FX: 813-224-9413
Cell: 941-720-3843

Mansfield Oil Company of
Gainesville, Inc.
1025 Airport Parkway SW
Gainesville, GA 30501-6813

David Zarfoss

PH: 800-255-6699
FX: 678-450-2242

Lynch Oil Company, Inc.

1244 E. Carroll Street
Kissimmee, FL 34744

Laurie Martin

PH: 407-847-4161
FX: 407-847-5111

TAC Energy

100 Crescent Ct., Ste 1600
Dallas, TX 75201

Clayton Wilson

PH: 972-807-7873

Indigo Energy Partners, LLC
P.O. Box 2535
Gainesville, GA 30503

Clayton Niegsch

PH: 678-600-8522
FX: 678-928-4925
Cell: 614-571-7352

Petroleum Traders Corporation
7120 Pointe Inverness Way
Fort Wayne, IN 46804

Gayle Newton

PH: 800-348-3705 opt 4
FX: 260-203-3820
Cell: 260-710-3103

Pro Energy LLC
1093 Shotgun Road
Sunrise, FL 33326

Clemente Cruz

PH: 954-431-5389
FX: 954-450-8084
Cell: 954-599-8090

PAPCO, Inc.
4920 Southern Blvd
Virginia Beach, VA 23462

Scott Effinger

PH: 757-321-4436
FX: 757-352-2178
Cell: 757-619-6192

V]
3rd Renewal expires: o larry.mcgary@jhwoil.com mocbids@mansfieldoil.com sales2@lynchoil.com cwilson@tacenergy.com cniegsch@indigoenergy.com |gnewton@petroleumtraders.com cecruz@proenergy.us scott.effinger@papco.com
SHADED AREA INDICATES AN AWARD | M Vendor #188031 Vendor # 250759 Vendor # 247898 Vendor # 128537 Vendor # 249482 Vendor # 149563 Vendor # 256341
Line [Number of Bid Responses: 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8
Item [Description of Item(s) Transport | Tank Wagon| Transport | Tank Wagon| Transport | Tank Wagon| Transport | Tank Wagon| Transport |Tank Wagon| Transport | Tank Wagon| Transport | Tank Wagon| Transport | Tank Wagon
A. gs‘sﬂze Regular Unleaded 87 |, 00050 | $0.2000 -$0.0162 | $0.2867 $0.025 $0.11 -$0.0115 | $0.2000 -$0.0253 No Bid -$0.0063 No Bid -$0.02 No Bid $0.0040 No Bid
B. g:g:e'l‘o(";”ri’é‘g”z’_gﬁ Road GA| $0.0050 | $0.2000 | -$0.0022 | $0.2867 | $0.0275 $0.10 $0.0040 | $0.2000 | $0.0029 No Bid No Bid No Bid -$0.01 NoBid | $0.0040 No Bid
Gasoline Reacreational Unleaded . . . . . .
C. 90 Octane, Ethanol Free GA| $0.0050 $0.2000 $0.0203 $0.3367 $0.0295 $0.12 -$0.0037 $0.2000 $0.035 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
D. |Drop Charges/Split Fee Delivery | $50.00 $40.00 $25.00 $30.00 $45.00 $40.00 $35.00 $75.00
(price per event)
E. |Pump Fee (price per event) EA $50.00 $40.00 $25.00 $30.00 $45.00 $50.00 $35.00 $150.00 Gas / $75.00 Diesel
F. “F";Séce"a”eous Fixed Delivery | $0.2000 $150.00 See Bid Response $250.00 N/A No Bid See Bid Response $100.00
G. |Acceptable Emergency Policy Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Exceptions N/A N/A N/A See Bid Response N/A N/A N/A N/A

Line Items A-C: Fixed Fee Markup per gallon to be added or deducted to/from the OPIS average base price
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