Supply Distribution Bureau
Donna Farnham, Warehouse Manager
(813) 247-8948

SHERIFF’S OFFICE

CHAD CHRONISTER, SHERIFF TAMPA, F

BID TABULATION - page 1 of 1

BID NUMBER:

11-19 Handcuffs & Related Deputy Equipment Global Strategies Solutions Dana Safety Supply Bob Barker GL Distributors, Inc GT Distributors, Inc
Opened: May 10, 2019 5402 W Laural St. 3810 West Osborne Avenue 134 N. Main St. 1849 Pine Blvd Ste 340 2545 Brockton Dr. Ste 100
Awarded: June 22, 2019 Tampa, FL 33607 Tampa, FL 33614 Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526 Pembroke Pines, FL 33029 Austin, TX 75758

1st Renewal Exp: June 22, 2021 Ph: 910-261-1225 Ph: 813-348-4866 Ph: 866-463-8514 Ph: 954-441-1473 Ph: 800-443-6283

2nd Renewal Exp: June 22, 2022

Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award William Dorofy Kevin Brennan Betsy Copeland Mark Altman Sandi White
Three (3) Annual Renewals bdorofy@globesgs.com |kbrennan@danasafetysupply.com| betsycopeland@bobbarker.com | mark@agldistributors.com | sandi.white@gtdist.com
(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS:

$18.70 each
$20.49 each * $20.30 each NO BID $19.77 each
A |Handcuffs - Peerless model # 700 $935.00 case of 50 $447.60 case of 24 N/A N/A
Plastic Flex Cuffs - Monadnock model #8220-3- $165.40 each NA
B 2B, black, 100 per case $174.00 case of 100 NO BID N/A NO BID $145.41 case of 100
$49.00 each
C |Leg Irons - Peerless model# 703C $147.00 case of 30 $49.50 each $54'$Aea°h NO BID NO BID
$8.40 each
) $8.99 each $9.39 each
OCP Gel - Sabre Red Ci fire MK-3 .
D epper Ge abre Red Crossfire $168.00 case of 20 $224.75 case of 25 NO BID $234.75 case of 25 NO BID
. $79.43 each $92.50 each ** $84.29 each $80.65 each
Defi B - Asp F21 | #5241
E |Defensive Baton - Asp C model # 52410 $471.00 case of 6 N/A NO BID N/A
Time for Delivery ARO 30 days 5 to 21 days 15-30 days 7-10 days 30 days
Exceptions NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE

Change order #2, change in Leg Irons from, CTS Thompson model # 9008 to Peerless model# 703C
Change order #1, Change in Vendor 20211026

* Price Increase in renewal #2

** New Product with increased price due to discontinuation of ltem E during renewal #2
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