
Heather Brewer, Buyer 
hbrewer@hcso.tampa.fl.us

813-247-0024

A $4,000.00 per 20 sets No Bid per 20 sets No Bid per 20 sets $3,257.00 per 20 sets $2,809.00 per 20 sets

B $250.00 per set No Bid per set No Bid per set $162.85 per set $140.45 per set 

C $240.00 per set No Bid per set No Bid per set $162.85 per set $95.40 per set

D $4,800.00 per 20 sets No Bid per 20 sets No Bid per 20 sets $3,257.00 per 20 sets $2,544.00 per 20 sets

E $300.00 per set No Bid per set No Bid per set $162.85 per set $127.20 per set

F $4,800.00 per 20 sets No Bid per 20 sets No Bid per 20 sets $3,257.00 per 20 sets $2,915.00 per 20 sets

G $300.00 per set No Bid per set No Bid per set $162.85 per set $145.75 per set

H $350.00 per set No Bid per set No Bid per set $162.85 per set $74.20 per set

I $100.000 per set No Bid per set No Bid per set $95.00 per set $39.75 per set

J $350.00 per set No Bid per set No Bid per set $190.00 per set $320.65 per set

K $500.00 per set No Bid per set No Bid per set $600.00 per set $397.50 per set

L $600.00 per set No Bid per set No Bid per set $650.00 per set $397.50 per set

*Rejected for being Non-
Responsive, no signatures

provided.

NONE

Price

*Sign Parrot.com, LLC
6400 East Columbus Drive

Tampa, FL 33619

Lisa Colon
OFC: 813-612-9200

lisac@signparrot.com

Vendor # 247657

CELL: 703-615-2283

Rogelio Ramirez
OFC: 813-936-9211
CELL: 813-503-4968

Regina Kline 
OFC: 813-719-8780
CELL: 813-763-3749
FAX: 813-752-5292

Justin Good 
OFC: 813-315-8403

Terms: One (1) Year Initial
Three (3) Annual Renewals
Renewal 1:
Renewal 2:

(Shaded Area Indicates Non-Responsive)

Price

Boat - 36 feet 

Exceptions: 

Notes: 

Decal Sets 

Sedan
(Bulk order of 20 sets)

Sedan

Compact Car 

SUV
(Bulk order of 20 sets)

SUV 

Truck

Vendor # 242036

Price

NONE

Mad Graphics, Inc. 

Vendor # 255727Vendor # 260082

Price

NONE

2711 Airport Road, ste 2
Plant City, FL 33563

tintpluspc@gmail.com

Vendor # 259374

5432 West Crenshaw St, ste C
Tampa, FL 33634

Art Designed/Tint Plus Redline Design, LLC
10220 Fisher Avenue, ste 10

Tampa, FL 33619

sales@redlinedesign.tvrobert@813tampaprinting.com

Tampa Printing
9017 East Adamo Drive ste102

Tampa, FL 33619

Robert Olson 

FAX: 866-839-7885

Bid 25-19 Custom Vehicle Decals 
Opened: December 17, 2019
Awarded:  January 16, 2020
Expires: January 15, 2021

(Highlighted Area Indicates Award)
roge@madgraphics.net

OFC: 813-664-0022
CELL: 813-230-9890

Price

Truck
(Bulk order of 20 sets)

Renewal 3:

Transportation Van 

Motorcycle 

Van with KUV Body 

Description of Items:

Boat - 40 feet 

NONE NONE
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Heather Brewer, Buyer 
hbrewer@hcso.tampa.fl.us

813-247-0024
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Lisa Colon

Tampa, FL 33619

$3.82 each**

$11.50 each***

NONE

*Rejected for being Non-
Responsive, no signatures 
provided. **Cost may increase due 
to contour cut ***License Plate not 
included.

Vendor # 247657

Price

$2.90 each

$3.82 each

$4.74 each

$5.66 each

$4.00 each

$5.50 each

$3.25 per set 

$0.49 each

$10.00 each

OFC: 813-612-9200

lisac@signparrot.com

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

$2.00 each

$3.00 each

$4.00 each 

$1.00 each

$2.00 each 

$3.00 each

Rogelio Ramirez

Art Designed/Tint Plus 
6400 East Columbus Drive

*Sign Parrot.com, LLC

$1.00 each

$1.00 each

$7.25 each

Three (3) Annual Renewals
Robert Olson 

OFC: 813-664-0022

Price Price

$1.00 each

$1.50 each 

Price

$9.34 each

$13.02 each

INDIVIDUAL DECALS

Renewal 2:

Awarded:  January 16, 2020
Opened: December 17, 2019

Renewal 1:

Page 2 of 4

HCSO Star - 4 inch 

(Shaded Area Indicates Non-Responsive) Vendor # 242036 Vendor # 259374 Vendor # pending Vendor # 255727

Description of Items:

Sheriff                         
Front License Plate 

Notes: NONE

robert@813tampaprinting.com sales@redlinedesign.tv roge@madgraphics.net tintpluspc@gmail.com
(Highlighted Area Indicates Award)

FAX: 813-752-5292
Renewal 3:

Regina Kline 
OFC: 813-719-8780

Terms: One (1) Year Initial

9017 East Adamo Drive ste102 10220 Fisher Avenue, ste 10

CELL: 813-230-9890 CELL: 703-615-2283 CELL: 813-503-4968 CELL: 813-763-3749

Justin Good 

2711 Airport Road, ste 2
Mad Graphics, Inc. 

OFC: 813-315-8403 OFC: 936-9211

Price

AED

Bid 25-19 Custom Vehicle Decals Tampa Printing Redline Design, LLC

HCSO Star - 3 inch 

Expires: January 15, 2021

HCSO Star - 14 inch 

American Flag               
4x6 inches 

NONE NONE NONE

Tampa, FL 33619 Tampa, FL 33619 Tampa, FL 33634 Plant City, FL 33563

FAX: 866-839-7885

5432 West Crenshaw St, ste C

Exceptions: NONE NONE NONE NONE

HCSO Star - 5 inch 

HCSO Star - 10 inch

mailto:lisac@signparrot.com#
mailto:robert@813tampaprinting.com
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mailto:roge@madgraphics.net#
mailto:tintpluspc@gmail.com#


Heather Brewer, Buyer 
hbrewer@hcso.tampa.fl.us

813-247-0024

Price Est. Time for 
Completion Price Est. Time for 

Completion Price Est. Time for 
Completion Price Est. Time for 

Completion Price Est. Time for 
Completion Price Est. Time for 

Completion 

U $250 ea 0.5 - 1 day $200 ea 0.5 - 1 day $180 ea 30 minutes $150 ea 1.5 - 2 hours $250 ea 0.5 day $250 ea 0.5 day

V $250 ea 0.5 - 1 day $200 ea 0.5 - 1 day $125 ea 30 minutes $150 ea 1.5 - 2 hours $250 ea 0.5 day $250 ea 0.5 day

W $250 ea 0.5 - 1 day $200 ea 0.5 - 1 day $180 ea 30 minutes $150 ea 1.5 - 2 hours $250 ea 0.5 day $250 ea 0.5 day

X $250 ea 0.5 - 1 day $200 ea 0.5 - 1 day $180 ea 30 minutes $150 ea 1.5 - 2 hours $250 ea 0.5 day $250 ea 0.5 day

Y $350 ea 0.5 - 1 day $250 ea 0.5 - 1 day $180 ea 40 minutes $200 ea 2 - 2.5 hours $350 ea 0.5 day $350 ea 0.5 day

Z $150 ea 0.5 - 1 day $150 ea 0.5 - 1 day $100 ea 10 minutes $100 ea 0.5 - 1 hours $100 ea 0.5 day $100 ea 0.5 day

AA $350 ea 0.5 - 1 day $250 ea 0.5 - 1 day $180 ea 40 minutes $200 ea 2 - 2.5 hours $250 ea 0.5 day $250 ea 0.5 day

BB $400 ea 0.5 - 1 day $350 ea 0.5 - 1 day $180 ea 20 minutes $200 ea 2 - 2.5 hours $350 ea 0.5 day $350 ea 0.5 day

Mad Graphics, Inc.
5432 West Crenshaw St, ste C

NONE 

roge@madgraphics.net

CELL: 813-503-4968

Tampa, FL 33634

Rogelio Ramirez
OFC: 936-9211

Expires: January 15, 2021
Terms: One (1) Year Initial
Three (3) Annual Renewals

Robert Olson Justin Good 

Page 3 of 4

Decal Application per Vehicle

OFC: 813-315-8403OFC: 813-664-0022

Vans

Motorcycles 

Vans with KUV Body 

Bid 25-19 Custom Vehicle Decals 

Decal Application per Vehicle

Boats 

DECAL APPLICATION AND 
REMOVAL 

Sedans 

(Highlighted Area Indicates Award)
(Shaded Area Indicates Non-Responsive)

Renewal 3:

Compact Cars 

robert@813tampaprinting.com

Vendor # 242036

Renewal 1:
Renewal 2:

Opened: December 17, 2019
Awarded:  January 16, 2020

Tampa Printing
9017 East Adamo Drive ste102

Tampa, FL 33619

CELL: 813-230-9890
FAX: 866-839-7885

Redline Design, LLC
10220 Fisher Avenue, ste 10

Tampa, FL 33619

CELL: 703-615-2283

sales@redlinedesign.tv

Vendor # 259374

Decal Removal per Vehicle Decal Removal per Vehicle 

NONE

Notes: 

Decal Removal per Vehicle Description of Items:

SUVs 

Trucks 

Vendor # pending

Decal Application per Vehicle

Exceptions: NONE NONE NONE NONE

NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE

mailto:roge@madgraphics.net#
mailto:robert@813tampaprinting.com#
mailto:sales@redlinedesign.tv#


Heather Brewer, Buyer 
hbrewer@hcso.tampa.fl.us

813-247-0024

Price Est. Time for 
Completion Price Est. Time for 

Completion Price Est. Time for 
Completion Price Est. Time for 

Completion 

U $150 ea  2 hours No Bid No Bid $160 ea 1 day $120 ea 1 day

V $140 ea  2 hours No Bid No Bid $110 ea 1 day $120 ea 1 day

W $150 ea  2 hours No Bid No Bid $145 ea 1 day $120 ea 1 day

X $150 ea  2 hours No Bid No Bid $165 ea 1 day $120 ea 1 day

Y $165 ea  2 hours No Bid No Bid $85 ea 1 day $120 ea 1 day

Z $95 ea  1.5 hours No Bid No Bid $60 ea 1 day $60 ea 1 day

AA $175 ea  2.5 hours No Bid No Bid $365 ea 1 day $240 ea 2 days

BB $650 ea 1 day No Bid No Bid $450 ea 1 day $240 ea 2 days

*Rejected for being Non-Responsive, no signatures 
provided. 

OFC: 813-719-8780

Expires: January 15, 2021
Terms: One (1) Year Initial
Three (3) Annual Renewals

Lisa Colon
OFC: 813-612-9200

Regina Kline 

NONE NONE

Notes: NONE NONE

NONE

Vans

Motorcycles 

Vans with KUV Body 

Boats 

Exceptions: NONE

DECAL APPLICATION AND 
REMOVAL 

Sedans 

Compact Cars 

SUVs 

Trucks 

(Shaded Area Indicates Non-Responsive) Vendor # 255727 Vendor # 247657

Description of Items: Decal Application per Vehicle Decal Removal per Vehicle Decal Application per Vehicle Decal Removal per Vehicle 

Bid 25-19 Custom Vehicle Decals Art Designed/Tint Plus *Sign Parrot.com, LLC
Opened: December 17, 2019 2711 Airport Road, ste 2 6400 East Columbus Drive
Awarded:  January 16, 2020 Plant City, FL 33563 Tampa, FL 33619

Renewal 1: CELL: 813-763-3749
Renewal 2: FAX: 813-752-5292
Renewal 3:

tintpluspc@gmail.com lisac@signparrot.com
(Highlighted Area Indicates Award)
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