
Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office Purchasing Unit

P.O. Box 3371 Carly Cartwright, Buyer

Tampa, FL  33601 (813) 247-0026

Tabb Textile Company Inc. Charm-Tex Inc. Unitex International, Inc. Brooke Supplies Textile Sales

511 Pleasant Dr 1618 Coney Island Ave. 680 satellite Blvd. NW, Ste 200 525 E. County Line Rd. Ste 6 8466 N. Lockwoodridge Rd.

Opelika, AL 36801 Brooklyn, NY 11230 Suwanee, GA 30024 Lakewood, NJ 08701 Sarasota, FL 34243

Ph: 334-745-6762 Ph: 718-252-8100 Ph: 770-232-0060 Ph: 732-901-6344 Ph: 443-286-3363

Fx: 334-745-2377 Fx: 718-258-8303 Fx: 770-232-0038 Fx: 732-730-7016 Fx: 443-548-0906

Marsha Thrift Caryn Schumer Nid Keophila Michael Mermelstein Gary Zemil

marcha@textilegroup.net caryn@charm-tex.com nid@unitexonline.com michael@brookesupplies.com Ph: 443-286-3363

Item #: A B C D E

10062
TB1ZZ                                     

$63.00 dz

Thermal20                         

5.90 ea

APC6690TB-W                     

$66.00 dz NO BID
TSWTB                            

$69.60 dz

10063
WB130                                   

$51.60 dz

BL/WB70                            

5.90 ea
NO BID PWB526284                     52.00 dz NO BID

10826
WC185                                 $2.20 

dz

WC1212J1.OP                  

2.90 dz

AT12121PB-DCC                  

$2.25 dz
NO BID $1.685 dz

10565 NO BID
30756W130 - TC130                      

36.90 dz

S3980-T30                             

$38.00 dz
NO BID $32.50 dz

10566
PS215 - TC180                                  

$43.00 dz

66104W130                      

39.90 dz NO BID NO BID
TS66104                         

$39.50 dz

MD250 - TC130                                  

$37.00 dz

10435
PC110 - TC180                                    

9.75 dz

4234W13                            

7.90 dz

S4234-T30                            

$10.00 dz
NO BID $12.90 dz

PC107 - TC130                                   

$7.80 dz

All Items - one case min.

Item A - 120 ea. min.               

Item B - 250 ea. min.              

Item C - 500 dz min.          

Item D & E - 50 dz min.         

Item F - 100 dz min.

Item A - 50 ea. min.                   

Item C - 100 dz min.                  

Item D - 10 dz min.                    

Item F - 25 dz min.                 

225 ea min.

Item A - 120 ea min.                             

Item C - 500 dz min.               

Item D - 50 dz min.                

Item E - 50 dz min.                

Item F - 100 dz min.

Yes Yes Yes Yes

15 days 7 days

Item A - 10 days                         

Item C - 5 days                         

Item D - 15 days                       

Item F - 5 days

7 days 10 days

NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE

QUOTATION TABULATION - Page 1 of 2

QUOTE NUMBER:

1-16 Inmate Linens

Opened: February 26, 2016

Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award

Awarded: April 12, 2016

Two (2) Annual Renewals

C) Wash Cloth

(SHADED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS:

A) Cotton Blanket

D) Fitted Sheet

E) Flat Sheet

B) Wool Blanket

Minimum Order Quantities

Samples Received with Bid Package

Business Days to Delivery ARO

EXCEPTIONS

F) Pillow Case

 
  

mailto:marcha@textilegroup.net
mailto:caryn@charm-tex.com
mailto:nid@unitexonline.com
mailto:michael@brookesupplies.com


Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office Purchasing Unit

P.O. Box 3371 Carly Cartwright, Buyer

Tampa, FL  33601 (813) 247-0026

Bob Barker Co.

134 N. Main Street

Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526

Ph: 800-334-9880

Fx: 800-322-7537

Abby Burleson

abbyburleson@bobbarker.com

Item #: F

10062
2127                                       

$85.02 dz

10063
WSB6280                              

$71.52 dz

10826
4040                                          

$2.68 dz

10565
FS3075P                                 

$37.24 dz

10566
SH66104P                               

$48.74 dz

10435
PC4234P                              

$11.84 dz

Item A - by dz., no min.            

Item B - sold ea., no min.     Items 

C - F - 1 dz min.          

Yes

3 - 7 days

NONE

QUOTATION TABULATION - Page 2 of 2

QUOTE NUMBER:

1-16 Inmate Linens

Opened: February 26, 2016

Terms: One (1 )Year Initial Award

Two (2) Annual Renewals

(SHADED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS:

Awarded: April 12, 2016

A) Cotton Blanket

B) Wool Blanket

C) Wash Cloth

EXCEPTIONS

Minimum Order Quantities

Samples Received with Bid Package

D) Fitted Sheet

E) Flat Sheet

F) Pillow Case

Business Days to Delivery ARO

 
  

mailto:abbyburleson@bobbarker.com

