
HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY SHERIFF’S OFFICE 

FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION – PURCHASING SECTION 

BID 6-20 INMATE LINENS, BATH TOWELS, AND UNDERGARMENTS 

QUESTIONS AND ANSWERS – AS OF JUNE 15, 2020 

 1 of 3 

 

Question #1:  Can you please share your current vendor and pricing for line item A? The bid tabulation 

for the last time linens were out to bid only show a cotton blanket and a wool-blend blanket. 

Answer #1:  The current vendor and price for line item A, Cotton Blanket, is Tabb Textile at $63.00/ 

dozen. 

Question #2:  For line item C, the flat sheet: do you have a specific measurement for the sheet, or is any 

sheet that fits a 30x76x5 mattress acceptable? 

Answer #2:  Any flat sheet that appropriately fits a 30” x 76” x 5” mattress is acceptable.  

Question #3:  Do you have a thread count requirement or preference on line items B, C, and D? 

Answer #3:   The thread count for items B, C, and D may vary as long as it remains within the required 

weight of 4.3 ounces per square yard. 

Question #4:  When the linen portion of this bid was out to bid last fall and subsequently cancelled, we 

had sent samples at that time. Will we need to send the same samples again for this bid? 

Answer #4:   Yes.  Bid 6-20 will require new samples. 

Question #5:  On the undergarment samples, would you like each of the 2 samples to be different sizes or 

the same size? Will you need the screened size indicators on all samples? 

Answer #5:   Each of the 2 samples shall be of the same size and each sample individually labeled with 

the Vendor’s name and item number.  No, the screened size does not need to be on each sample.  

Question #6:  Regarding the bid referenced above, can you please advise who was awarded these 

items before and at what price? 

Answer #6:   Quotation Tabulation sheets from the last awarded bids are attached.  Awarded items are 

highlighted in yellow on the Quotation Tabulation sheets. 

Question #7:  Can you please provide the last bid award tabulation and the name of your current 

supplier? 

Answer #7:   Quotation Tabulation sheets from the last awarded bids are attached.  Awarded items are 

highlighted in yellow on the Quotation Tabulation sheets.  The list of current vendors is below: 

Item Description Current Vendor  Item Description Current Vendor 

A Blanket Tabb Text  F Wash Cloth Tabb Text 

B Fitted Sheet Tabb Text  G Sports Bra Bob Barker 

C Flat Sheet Bob Barker  H Women’s Panties Bob Barker 

D Pillow Case Tabb Text  I Men’s Boxers Bob Barker 

E Bath Towel Bob Barker  J Crew Socks Bob Barker 
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Question #8:  Can you please provide the exact size of fitted and flat sheet which you are using now? 

Answer #8:   The current size of the flat sheet in use is 106” long x 66” wide and the current size of the 

fitted sheet in use is 76” long x 32” wide x 4” pockets. 

Question #9:  Can we please bid the line items # 2,3,4,5 & 6?? 

Answer #9:   Yes.  Line items may be bid in part or in whole as the HCSO reserves the right to award 

by line item or by overall total, whichever is deemed in the best interest of the HCSO. 

Question #10:  The “Vendor Application Form,” you’d like to provide the following documentation, 

“Business Tax Receipt for Hillsborough County or other municipality’s business license.” Would 

sending our Certificate of Good Standing be accepted? 

Answer #10:   The Vendor Packet attached as Appendix I must be returned with your Bid Response 

along with copies of Hillsborough County Business Tax Receipt, other local government, or state 

business license(s).  Include any licenses or registrations which may be applicable. 

Question #11:  Please clarify the specification for Flat Sheets (Item “C”) page 15.  The previous 

bid specification (Item D of ITB 17-19) called for a “finished size to fit mattress size 66” x 96” (+/- 

½”)” 

The spec in this bid calls for “finished size to fit mattress size 30” x 76” x 5”… “ 

Is this an error? 

Answer #11:  The sheets shall fit mattress size 30”x76”x5”.  

Question #12:  It is stated in the Bid 6-20 that sizes for both fitted and flat sheets are 30" x 76" x 

5". Flat sheet sizes are mentioned as, Width x Length with top and bottom hem, for example 34" x 

84"  +/- 1" hem. The size for flat sheets could not be written as stated in bid, they do not have a 

drop of 5" like fitted sheets. For example, If you put a flat sheet on a flat surface it will have 2 equal 

sides with equal length and equal widths, but it cannot have a drop of 5".  

Answer #12:  The width plus length of the flat sheet should have a finished size to be used on a 

mattress size 30” x 76” x 5” as stated on Bid 6-20 Part C, Paragraph 2, Item C. 

Question #13:  What fabric should be used in sheets, woven fabric or knitted fabric? 

Answer #13:  The fabric used in the sheets may be woven or knitted but must retain the requested 

specifications of being 50% cotton / 50% polyester (+/- 5%), weight of 4.3 ounces per square yard 

and shrinkage not to exceed 5%. 
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Question #14:  On the last item….it says CREW sock but then says ankle cuff 2 ½ inches.  Do you 

want a crew sock or an ankle sport sock? 

Answer #14:  A sock with a 2 ½” ankle cuff is required.  The product may be referred to differently 

depending on the Manufacturer. 

Question #15:  Item J1 – Crew sock has a description of ANKLE CUFF approximately 2 ½ 

……….Do you want an ankle sock or a crew sock.  Crew socks do not have an ankle cuff. 

Answer #15:  See Answer #14. 

Question #16:  Quantity for Line A1 of 50 each seem small compared to other lines.  Is this 

accurate, 50 each or should it be 50 cases? 

Answer #16:  50 each is the correct estimated annual usage. 



Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office Purchasing Unit
P.O. Box 3371 Carly Cartwright, Buyer
Tampa, FL  33601 (813) 247-0026

Bid 19-16 Inamte Undergarments Robinson Enterprises, Inc. Uniforms MFG, Inc. Bob Barker ICS Jail Supplies, Inc. JNC Supplies, INC
Opening: June 6, 2016 1001 Tennessee Ave 7575 E Redfield Rd 134 N. Main Street P.O. Box 21056 367 Windsor HWY

Morrilton, FR 72110 Scottsdale, AZ 85260 Fuguary Varina, NC 27526 Waco, TX 76702 New Windsor, NY 12553
Ph: 801-354-3451 Ph: 800-222-1474 ext: 105 Ph: 800-334-9880 Ph: 800-524-5427 Ph: 845-738-1404

Wayne Elliott Nilo Saif Abby Burleson Maegan Eisenman Joe Walter
Wayne.Elliott@Robinson-Enterprise.com Nilo@UMIDriect.com abbyburleson@bobbarker.com Bids@icswaco.com joe@jncsupplies.com

DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS: A B C D E
532-548 340-12 EBASPLS C1910 HBF4499

Size: 32-40 / $30.00 Size: 32-48 / $17.04 Size: 32-42 / $16.60 Size: 32-40 / $27.00 Size: 32-40 / $18.90
Size: 42-48 / $34.20 Size: 44-48 / $17.85 Size: 42-48 / $32.00 Size: 42-48 / $19.95

405-413 300-1 ELBLCTN C062W HBF6888
Size: 5-9 / $11.40 Size: 5-10 / $7.29 Size: 5-8 / $6.14 Size: 5-8 / $9.00 Size: 5-9 / $7.25

Size: 10-13 / $12.60 Size: 11-13 / $8.19 Size: 9-13 / $6.97 Size: 9-13 / $11.00 Size: 10-13 / $8.85
201-218 330-1 EBXLSQ C052W HBF185

Size: S-XL / $15.60 Size: S-XL / $11.52 Size: S-4XL / $11.50 Size: S-5XL / $15.00 Size: S-2XL / $11.65
Size: 2XL-15XL / $18.00 Size: 2XL-15XL / price sheet Size: 5XL-15XL / $17.70 Size: 6XL-15XL / 37.00 Size: 3XL-6XL / $14.50

Size: 7XL-10XL / $18.00
Size: 11XL-15XL / special order

1200 / $5.64 502-3 / $4.09 M4595 / $3.80 C068-10 / $5.50 Sample E1 - HBF187 / $4.21
Sample E2 - HB419A / $4.21

YES YES YES YES YES

7 Days 15 Days 5-15 Days 5-7 Days                     
Boxers: Size 6X-15X - 30 Days 14 Days

Bra - 10 dz / 20 per cs               Panties 
- 12 dz / 24 dz per cs       Boxers - 6 dz  

Socks - 10 dz
1 Dozen

Bra- 1 cs / 12 per cs             
Panties- 1 cs / 25 per cs          

Boxers- 1 cs                   
Socks- 1 cs

10 Dozen 1 Dozen

NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE

Awarded: June 20, 2016

SPORTS BRA:

EXCEPTIONS

QUOTATION TABULATION - Page 1 of 2

    Size Range / Price per Dozen
WOMEN'S PANTIES:

Minimum Order Quantities

Samples Received 

    Size Range / Price per Dozen
MEN'S BOXERS:

    Size Range / Price per Dozen

    Size Range / Price per Dozen

QUOTE NUMBER:

Renewal 2: 6/20/18 - 6/19/19

(SHADED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

    Size Range / Price per Dozen
    Size Range / Price per Dozen

    Size Range / Price per Dozen
    Size Range / Price per Dozen

CREW SOCK:

Business Days to Delivery ARO

Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award
Two (2) Annual Renewals
Renewal 1: 6/20/17-6/19/18



Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office Purchasing Unit
P.O. Box 3371 Carly Cartwright, Buyer
Tampa, FL  33601 (813) 247-0026

Bid 19-16 Inamte Undergarments ATD American Co. Holmdel Footwear Charm-Tex
Opening: June 6, 2016 135 Greenwood Ave 4 Timber Ln, unit C2 1618 Coney Island Ave

Wyncote, PA 19095 Marlboro, NJ 07746 Brooklyn, NY 11230
Ph: 215-576-1000 ext: 2256 Ph: 877-901-3668 Ph: 718-252-8100

Sharon Sowton Wendy Zamkoff Stan Danzger
sgowton@atd-american.com stan@charm-tex.com

F G H
SBPR Sbra3830 CL/Sbra

Size: 32-38 / $19.48 Size: 32-44 / $21.00 Size: 32-42 / $19.14
Size: 40-48 / $21.48 Size: 46-52 / $24.00 Size: 44-48 / $20.18

870/871/872 PNTY CL/PANT
Size: 5-8 / $7.22 Size: 5-10 / $9.00 Size: 5-8 / $6.54

Size: 9-13 / $8.22 Size: 11-13 / $11.00 Size: 9-13 / $7.84
8354/8358 KBSW CL/Boxer

Size: S-XL / $10.98 Size: S-XL / $10.95 Size: S-2XL / $13.90
Size: 2XL-6XL / $13.98 Size: 2XL-3XL / $11.95 Size: 3XL / $14.90
Size: 7XL-15XL / $31.98 Size: 4XL-5XL / $12.95 Size: 4XL-10XL / $19.90

Size: 6XL / $13.95 Size: 11XL-15XL / $28.90     special 
order

Size: 7XL-10XL / $15.95
802-201 / $4.38 Crew / $4.25 sck/crew / $4.39

YES YES

15 Days                         
Boxers Size: 7XL-15XL - 30 Days 14 Days

7-30 Days                     
Boxers Size: 11XL-15XL             90-

120 Days

1 Dozen                         
Socks- 20 Dozen

Bra- 1 cs / 10 dz per cs   Panties- 
1 cs / 25 dz per cs     Boxer's- 1 cs 
/ 12 dz per cs    Socks- 1 cs / 20 

dz per cs          

NONE

NONE    BOXERS SAMPLES NOT 
RECEIVED NONE

Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award
Two (2) Annual Renewals
Renewal 1: 6/20/17-6/19/18

    Size Range / Price per Dozen

QUOTATION TABULATION - Page 2 of 2

QUOTE NUMBER:

DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS:
(SHADED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

Awarded: June 20, 2016

CREW SOCK

Samples Received 

    Size Range / Price per Dozen
    Size Range / Price per Dozen

    Size Range / Price per Dozen

    Size Range / Price per Dozen

    Size Range / Price per Dozen
WOMEN'S PANTIES

    Size Range / Price per Dozen
MEN'S BOXERS

    Size Range / Price per Dozen

EXCEPTIONS

Business Days to Delivery ARO

Minimum Order Quantities

    Size Range / Price per Dozen

SPORTS BRA

Renewal 2: 6/20/18 - 6/19/19



Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office Purchasing Unit

P.O. Box 3371 Carly Cartwright, Buyer

Tampa, FL  33601 (813) 247-0026

Tabb Textile Company Inc. Charm-Tex Inc. Unitex International, Inc. Brooke Supplies Textile Sales

511 Pleasant Dr 1618 Coney Island Ave. 680 satellite Blvd. NW, Ste 200 525 E. County Line Rd. Ste 6 8466 N. Lockwoodridge Rd.

Opelika, AL 36801 Brooklyn, NY 11230 Suwanee, GA 30024 Lakewood, NJ 08701 Sarasota, FL 34243

Ph: 334-745-6762 Ph: 718-252-8100 Ph: 770-232-0060 Ph: 732-901-6344 Ph: 443-286-3363

1st Renewal Exp: April 11, 2018 Fx: 334-745-2377 Fx: 718-258-8303 Fx: 770-232-0038 Fx: 732-730-7016 Fx: 443-548-0906

2nd Renewal Exp: April 11, 2019

Marsha Thrift Caryn Schumer Nid Keophila Michael Mermelstein Gary Zemil

marcha@textilegroup.net caryn@charm-tex.com nid@unitexonline.com michael@brookesupplies.com Ph: 443-286-3363

Item #: A B C D E

10063
TB122                                     

$63.00 dz

Thermal20                         

5.90 ea

APC6690TB-W                     

$66.00 dz NO BID
TSWTB                            

$69.60 dz

10062
WB130                                   

$54.24 dz

BL/WB70                            

5.90 ea
NO BID PWB526284                     52.00 dz NO BID

10826
WC185                                 $2.20 

dz

WC1212J1.OP                  

2.90 dz

AT12121PB-DCC                  

$2.25 dz
NO BID $1.685 dz

10565 NO BID
30756W130 - TC130                      

36.90 dz

S3980-T30                             

$38.00 dz
NO BID $32.50 dz

10566
PS215 - TC180                                  

$43.00 dz

66104W130                      

39.90 dz NO BID NO BID
TS66104                         

$39.50 dz

MD250 - TC130                                  

$37.00 dz

10435
PC110 - TC180                                    

9.75 dz

4234W13                            

7.90 dz

S4234-T30                            

$10.00 dz
NO BID $12.90 dz

PC107 - TC130                                   

$7.80 dz

All Items - one case min.

Item A - 120 ea. min.               

Item B - 250 ea. min.              

Item C - 500 dz min.          

Item D & E - 50 dz min.         

Item F - 100 dz min.

Item A - 50 ea. min.                   

Item C - 100 dz min.                  

Item D - 10 dz min.                    

Item F - 25 dz min.                 

225 ea min.

Item A - 120 ea min.                             

Item C - 500 dz min.               

Item D - 50 dz min.                

Item E - 50 dz min.                

Item F - 100 dz min.

Yes Yes Yes Yes

15 days 7 days

Item A - 10 days                         

Item C - 5 days                         

Item D - 15 days                       

Item F - 5 days

7 days 10 days

NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE

** Price increase on wool blanks during 2nd renewal. -CC

QUOTATION TABULATION - Page 1 of 2

QUOTE NUMBER:

1-16 Inmate Linens

Opened: February 26, 2016

Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award

Awarded: April 12, 2016

Two (2) Annual Renewals

C) Wash Cloth

(SHADED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS:

A) Cotton Blanket

B) Wool Blanket

D) Fitted Sheet

E) Flat Sheet

Minimum Order Quantities

Samples Received with Bid Package

Business Days to Delivery ARO

EXCEPTIONS

F) Pillow Case

 
  

mailto:marcha@textilegroup.net
mailto:caryn@charm-tex.com
mailto:nid@unitexonline.com
mailto:michael@brookesupplies.com


Hillsborough County Sheriff's Office Purchasing Unit

P.O. Box 3371 Carly Cartwright, Buyer

Tampa, FL  33601 (813) 247-0026

Bob Barker Co.

134 N. Main Street

Fuquay-Varina, NC 27526

Ph: 800-334-9880

Fx: 800-322-7537

Abby Burleson

abbyburleson@bobbarker.com

Item #: F

10062
2127                                       

$85.02 dz

10063
WSB6280                              

$71.52 dz

10826
4040                                          

$2.68 dz

10565
FS3075P                                 

$37.24 dz

10566
SH66104P                               

$48.74 dz

10435
PC4234P                              

$11.84 dz

Item A - by dz., no min.            

Item B - sold ea., no min.     Items 

C - F - 1 dz min.          

Yes

3 - 7 days

NONE

QUOTATION TABULATION - Page 2 of 2

QUOTE NUMBER:

1-16 Inmate Linens

Opened: February 26, 2016

1st Renewal Exp: April 11, 2018

Terms: One (1 )Year Initial Award

Two (2) Annual Renewals

(SHADED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS:

Awarded: April 12, 2016

A) Cotton Blanket

B) Wool Blanket

C) Wash Cloth

EXCEPTIONS

Minimum Order Quantities

Samples Received with Bid Package

D) Fitted Sheet

E) Flat Sheet

F) Pillow Case

Business Days to Delivery ARO

 
  

mailto:abbyburleson@bobbarker.com


General Services Bureau

Carly Cartwright, Buyer

(813) 247-0026

Bob Barker Company American Pride Linen Company Justice Packaging Tabb Textile Co., Inc. Charm-Tex Tex Tile Sales

P.O. Box 429 3870 Peachtree Ind. Suite 340 #122 202 Bourne Blvd. Suite 130 511 Pleasant Dr. 1618 Coney Island Ave. 8466 N. Lockwood Ridge Rd.

Fuguay-Virina, NC 27526 Duluth, GA 30096 Savannah, GA 31408 Opelika, AL  36801 Brooklyn, NY 11230 Sarasota, FL 34243

Ph: 800-334-9880 Ph: 678-551-2752 Ph: 800-253-2352 Ph: 334-745-6762 Ph: 718-250-8100 Ph: 443-286-3363

Fax: 800-322-7537 Fax: 678-281-7554 Fax: 866-554-2569 Fax: 334-745-2399 Fax: 718-258-8303 Fax: 443-548-0906

Amber Garcia Paawan Mathur David Hagan Marsha Thrift Stan Danzger Gary Zemil

ambergarcia@bobbarker.com pmathur@americanpridelinen.com dave@justicepkg.com marsha@textilegroup.net stan@charn-tex.com tex.tile@verizon.net

Sample A Sample B Sample C Sample D Sample E Sample F

Sample A1 - BT2244 - $13.40 dz   

Sample A2 - 41400 - $12.50 dz      
No Bid

Sample C1                                   

HP-224410S6.0                      

$0.91 each

Sample D1                   

Economy BT150                 

$9.85 per dz

BT2040J5.5E                 

$10.90 per dz

Sample F1                                

TS 2244                                   

$11.38 per dz                          

Sample A3 - 4220 - $13.40 dz                                      

Sample A4 - 4250 / $15.80 dz             

BT550                                                    

$14.45 per dz

Sample C2                                   

HP-224416S6.0                      

$1.12 each

Sample D2                

Premium BT270             

$12.63 per dz

No Bid

Sample F2                                

TS 2040PC                          

$10.55 per dz                                

YES YES YES YES YES YES

3 - 10 Days 7 Calendar Days 5-7 Days Within 30 Days 3 - 7 Days 10 Days

None
Minimum order qty: 50 dz  /                     

25 dz per bale
Minimum order qty: 100 dz Minimum order qty: 100 dz Minimum order qty: 200 dz 25 dz per bale

** Note - 9% price increase during 1st annual renewal.

** Note - 7% price increase during 2nd annual renewal.

Opened: August 26, 2016

85% Cotton / 15% Polyester Towel

Terms: One Year Initial Award

Two (2) Annual Renewals

(SHADED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS:

Business Days to Delivery ARO

EXCEPTIONS

Samples Rec'd

QUOTATION TABULATION - Page 1 of 1

QUOTE NUMBER: 

TC: 11-16, Inmate Bath Towels

Awarded: October 17, 2016

1st Renewal Exp: October 17, 2018

100% Cotton Towel

2nd Renewal Exp: October 17, 2019

mailto:ambergarcia@bobbarker.com#
mailto:pmathur@americanpridelinen.com#
mailto:dave@justicepkg.com#
mailto:marsha@textilegroup.net#
mailto:stan@charn-tex.com#
mailto:tex.tile@verizon.net#



