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Heather Brewer, Buyer 

hbrewer@hcso.tampa.fl.us
813-247-0024

Dana Safety Supply Truck Outfitters & Accessories GT Distributors, Inc. 
3810 West Osborne Road 

Tampa, FL 33614

OFC: (813) 348-4866 OFC: (850) 329-2992 OFC: (800) 252-8310
FAX: (813) 348-0450

Kevin Brennan Jerry Shaffer Peter Hernandez
kbrennan@danasafetysupply.com

Vendor #: 233855

Line # Item # Item Specifications Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price 

A PK0325CGR11 Setina© Model 8S – Lexan                                                 
Estimated Quantity – 50  

$449.50 / each NO BID NO BID 

B ST0380CGR11 Setina© 2-pc Lower Extension Panels                          
Estimated Quantity – 50

$59.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

C RWB-DC2 Brooking Industries© Rr Wdw Barriers            
Estimated Quantity – 50  

$99.12 / each NO BID NO BID 

D 7170-0564-02 Gamber Johnson© Console Box Pkg                   
Estimated Quantity – 50

$571.50 / each NO BID NO BID 

E 7160-0500 Gamber Johnson© Swg Arm w/ Clevis                        
Estimated Quantity – 50 

 $186.50 / each NO BID NO BID 

F 5077GOR Go Rhino© Push Bumper                                                    
Estimated Quantity – 50  

$191.89 / each NO BID NO BID 

G 5077W Go Rhino© Hi-Gloss Push Bpr Wrap                  
Estimated Quantity – 50 

$163.89 / each NO BID NO BID 

Line # Item # Item Specifications Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price 

H PK0369TAH15SCA Setina© 8 VS Recessed Panel Poly Prt            
Estimated Quantity - 150 

$559.50 / each NO BID NO BID 

I WK0514TAH15H Setina© Steel VS Hrztl Window Barrier            
Estimated Quantity - 150

$179.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

J PK0316TAH152ND Setina© 12VS Poly Rear Partition              
Estimated Quantity - 150                       

$325.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

K TK0250TAH15 Setina© Cargo Box                                    
Estimated Quantity - 150

$1,025.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

L WK0040TAH15 Setina© Rear Compartment Barriers           
Estimated Quantity - 150

$249.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

Renewal 1: 
Renewal 2:

DODGE CHARGER
DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS:

Chevrolet Tahoe 

Renewal 3:

Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award
Three (3) Annual Renewals

(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

BID NUMBER:
1-20 Vehicle Equipment 
Opened: February 5, 2020
Awarded: March 19, 2020
Expires: March 18, 2021 

mailto:kbrennan@danasafetysupply.com
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M BK0534TAH15PB8
Setina© PB400 VS Aluminum Bumper 
with PB8                                                        
Estimated Quantity - 150      

$525.50 / each NO BID NO BID 

N HK0809TAH15 Setina© PB8 Headlight Wrap                              
Estimated Quantity - 150

$249.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

O 7170-0237-04 Gamber Johnson© Console Package          
Estimated Quantity - 150

$751.50 / each NO BID NO BID 

P 7160-0430
Gamber Johnson© VS External Armrest 
Brother Printer Mount                       
Estimated Quantity - 150

$263.50 / each NO BID NO BID 

Line # Item # Item Specifications Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price 

Q PK0709FDT15F150 Setina© 8VS Flat Panel Partition                                
Estimated Quantity - 25

$475.50/ each NO BID NO BID 

R 2K0035FDT15F150FSetina© Prisoner Divider                           
Estimated Quantity - 25

$369.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

S WK0514FDT15F150 Setina© Steel Horizontal Window Barrier 
Estimated Quantity - 25

$189.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

T WK0626FDT15F150 Setina© Rear Window Expanded Metal 
Barrier Estimated Quantity - 25

$169.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

Line # Item # Item Specifications Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price 

U BK0534DUR11 Setina© PB400 Aluminum Push Bumper 
Estimated Quantity - 150

$279.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

V HK0809DUR11
Setina© PB8 Headlight Guard Double 
Loop Wrap                                        
Estimated Quantity - 150

$249.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

W PK0709 Setina© 8VS Flat Panel Partition               
Estimated Quantity - 150

$475.50 / each NO BID NO BID 

X 2K0035 Setina© Prisoner Divider                             
Estimated Quantity - 150

$369.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

Y  SMC Setina© Steel Horizontal Window Barrier                                                                                      
Estimated Quantity - 150 $189.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

Z  SMC
Setina© Rear Window Expanded Metal 
Barrier                                                   
Estimated Quantity - 150

$169.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

AA 7170-0721-02
Gamber Johnson© Console w/ cup 
holder/printer                                             
Estimated Quantity - 150

$638.50 / each NO BID NO BID 

Ford F150

Dodge Ram 
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BB PK0369ITU20 Setina© 8VS RP Stationary Window          
Estimated Quantity - 50

$559.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

CC WK0514ITU20H Setina© Steel Horizontal Window Barrier                                                                               
Estimated Quantity - 50 $179.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

DD PK0316ITU202ND Setina© Second Coated Poly Partition         
Estimated Quantity - 50

$329.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

EE TK0250ITU20 Setina© Cargo Box                                    
Estimated Quantity - 50

$1,025.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

FF WK0040ITU20
Setina© 3 pc Horizontal Rear Cargo 
Window Barriers                                   
Estimated Quantity - 50

$249.00 / each NO BID NO BID 

GG 5344T
Go Rhino© Steel Push Bumper Textured 
Powder                                                  
Estimated Quantity - 50

$259.94 / each NO BID NO BID 

HH 5344WHDT
Go Rhino© Steel Headlight Wrap 
Textured Powder                                              
Estimated Quantity - 50

$263.44 / each NO BID NO BID 

NONE Exceptions

Ford Interceptor 
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