
General Services Bureau

 Carly Cartwright, Buyer

(813) 247-0026

Lawmen's & Shooter' Supply Dana Safety Supply Bob Barker Co. Galls Law Enforcement Supply Young Guns Embroidery

7750 9th St. SW 4832 N. Orange Trail 134 N. Main St 1340 Russell Cave Dr 1257 Kennestone Cir 143 Scarlet Blvd

Vero Beach, FL 32968 Orlando, FL 32810 Fuquay Varina, NC 27526 Lexington, KY 40505 Marietta, GA 30066 Oldsmar, FL 34677

800-562-5697 x:218 407-880-2769 1-800-334-9880 1-800-876-4242 x:2328 1-800-522-8949 x:4313 813-814-9172

Contract Contact: 

Gail Walker-Keen Kevin Brennan Betsy Copeland Misty Hollan Daniel Hunter John Skiadas

bids@lawmens.net kbrennan@danasafetysupply.com betsycopeland@bobbarker.com Holland-Misty@Galls.com dhunter@lawsupply.com yg4apparel@gmail.com

A NO BID NO BID $5.45 $6.20 NO BID
Item # RC-SH-LRG                            

$6.90

Item # 9100SC                                          

S-XXL - $47.99

Item # 9100SC                                  

S-XXL - $50.00

3XL-6XL - $52.01 3XL-4XL - $55.00

ALTERNATE BRAND: Item # LHV-

207                                      

$27.79

2XL-4XL - $30.31

D NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item # GL249                                 

$4.40

ALTERNATE BRAND: Ringer            

Item # R307GR                                     

Sizes XS-3X: $10.00 

ALTERNATE BRAND: RINGERS          

Item # 306-08                                 

$12.85

E NO BID NO BID NO BID
Item # 8100                                  

$7.60
NO BID $6.69 

Item # SJG200-SPG                           

S-XL - $4.20

2XL-4XL - $6.00

Nickel: $3.38                             Nickel: $1.69 Nickel: $19.95 per dz Nickel: $1.87 Nickel: $1.75 Nickel: $1.90

Gold: $3.68 Gold: $1.69 Gold: $21.60 per dz Gold: $1.87 Gold: $1.75 Gold: $1.95

Item B: 30-60 days                                      

Item C: 20 days                                        

Item G: 30 days

30-45 Days

Item A: 30 days                            

Item B: 14-21 days                      

Item F: 30 days                             

Item G: 10-21 days

Item A & E: 30 days                          

Item B: 60 days                              

Item C & D: 7-30 days                                                                        

Item G: 10 days

Item B & C: 15-30 days                            

Item D & G: 5-7 days                       
10-14 days

Item B - minimum order: 5                 

Item Item G - mimimum order: 1 

dz

NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE

BID TABULATION - page 1 of 1

3rd Renewal Expires:

Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award

Three (3) Annual Renewals

Traffic Safety Gloves - Galls relfective safety gloves - 

Item # GL249-(size), lime color

Baseball Cap

DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS:

B

C

BID NUMBER:

21-17 Law Enforcement Uniform Accessories

Opened: January 26, 2018

Awarded:  February 16, 2018

Expires: February 15, 2019

2nd Renewal Expires:

(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

1st Renewal Expires:

NO BID

Item # RW581 / 9100SC                              

$62.70            

Item # HS337 / 207                              

$28.00

Hat Protectors - Stratton F-42, clear vinyl

Raincoat - Neese Air High Visibility Coat - Item # 

9100SC, lime color with "SHERIFF" on back

Item # 9100SC                                      

$44.10                           

NO BID
Traffic Safety Vest - Galls 207 Zip-N-Rip breakaway 

vest - Item # HS337

NO BIDNO BIDT-Shirt

Time for Delivery ARO

Exceptions

WhistleG

NO BIDF

$55.09 

ALTERNATE BRAND: Radians            

Item # LHZ073GSHF                                     

Sizes Reg - Jumbo: $30.00

NO BID

S-XXL: $59.29                                     

4XL-6XL: $63.57

ALTERNATE BRAND: 

Occunomix            Item # LUX-

PSS-DOR                       $19.75

S-XL: $5.75                                           

XXL: $7.25                                               

3XL: $8.50
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