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Inital Tabulation Sheet

                
Opened: March 15, 2024 Acme Supply Co. LTD Goaltex Corp Pride Enterprises Bob Barker Victory Supply LLC
Awarded: Tuesday, April 30, 2024
Initial Term Expires: April 30, 2025 10 Cedar Swanp Rd Suite 7 146 Split Rock Rd 1463 Oakfield Dr. #126 7925 Purfoy Rd 7025 Industrial Park Rd
Renewal 1 Expires: Glen Cove New York 11542 Syosset New York 11791 Brandon, FL. 33511 Fuquay Varina, NC. 27526 Mount Pleasant, TN. 38474
Renewal 2 Expires:
Renewal 3 Expires: Zaheer Sheik Robert Grubman Mary Jacobs Betsy Copeland Sondra Boston
Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award 1-800-567-8025 516-682-5775 813-890-6557 919-753-1654 888-376-1205
Three (3) Annual Renewals bn@acmesupply.us robert@goaltex.com customerservice@pride-enterprises.org betsycopeland@bobbarker.com sales@victorysupplyinc.com
(HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD)

DESCRIPITION HCSO ITEM 
NUMBER Each Price Case Price Case/ Each Price Case/ Each Price Case/ Each Price

1 ITEM-00154 - Inmate Pant - Disposable - Size Lg 00154 No Bid $255.88 $110 Case                                                  
Min. Order 50cs

$78.00 Case / $1.56ea                        
Case =50pcs ZDSCRPV-L

$107 Case/ 1.07ea 
Case=100pcs

2 ITEM-00155 - Inmate Pant - Disposable - Size 2Xl 00155 No Bid $261.47 $110 Case                                    
Min. Order 50cs

$82.00 Case / $1.64ea                      
Case =50pcs ZDSCRPNV-2XL

$107 Case/ 1.07ea 
Case=100pcs

3 ITEM-00156 - Inmate Pant - Orange- Size Sm 00156 $6.00 $275.99 $6.60ea Case= 36pcs  $72.00 Case / $6.00ea                     
Case=12pcs VFT-O-S

  $159.84 Case/ $6.66ea                                   
Case= 24pcs 

4 ITEM-00157 - Inmate Pant - Orange - Size Med 00157 $6.00 $275.99 $6.60ea Case= 36pcs $72.00 Case/ $6.00ea                        
Case =12pcs VFT-O-M

$159.84 Case/ $6.66ea                                          
Case= 24pcs 

5 ITEM-00158 - Inmate Pant - Orange - Size Lg 00158 $6.00 $275.99 $6.60ea Case= 36pcs $75.00 Case/ $6.25ea                       
Case =12pcs VFT-O-L

$159.84 Case/ $6.66ea                                          
Case= 24pcs 

6 ITEM-00159 - Inmate Pant - Orange - Size Xl 00159 $6.00 $275.99 $6.60ea Case= 36pcs $78.00 Case/ $6.50                            
Case =12pcs VFT-O-XL

$159.84 Case/ $6.66ea                                          
Case= 24pcs 

7 ITEM-00160 - Inmate Pant - Orange - Size 2xl 00160 $6.00 $275.99 $7.45ea Case=36pcs $78.00 Case/ $6.50                            
Case =12pcs VFT-O-2XL

$159.84 Case/ $6.66ea                                          
Case= 24pcs 

8 ITEM-00161 - Inmate Pant - Orange - Size 3xl 00161 $6.00 $286.26 $7.45ea Case=30pcs $81.00 Case/ $6.75ea                       
Case =12pcs VFT-O-3XL

$167.76 Case/ $6.99ea                     
Case=24pcs

9 ITEM-00162 - Inmate Pant - Orange - Size 4xl 00162 $6.00 $296.53 $7.67ea  Case=30pcs $84.00 Case $7.00ea                         
Case =12pcs VFT-O-4XL

$175.92 Case/ $7.33ea                     
Case= 24pcs

10 ITEM-00163 - Inmate Pant - Orange - Size 5xl 00163 $6.00 $306.80 $8.05ea Case=30pcs $90.00 Case/ $7.50                            
Case =12pcs VFT-O-5XL

$183 Case/ $7.65ea                            
Case= 24pcs

11 ITEM-00183 - Inmate Shirt - Disposable - Size Lg 00183 No Bid $250.29 $100.00 Case Min.Order 50cs $75.00 Case  / $1.50ea                     
Case =50pcs ZDSCRTNV-L

$107 Case/ $1.07ea                          
Case=100pcs 

12 ITEM-00184 - Inmate Shirt - Disposable - Size 2Xl 00184 No Bid $255.88 $100.00 Case Min. Order 50cs $77.00 Case/ $1.54ea                         
Case =50pcs ZDSCRTNV-2XL

$107 Case/ $1.07ea                          
Case=100pcs 
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13 ITEM-00185 - Inmate Shirt - Orange - Size Sm 00185 $5.50 $247.57  $7.02ea Case= 50pcs $77.00 Case / $6.41666666666667ea                                
Case =12pcs VFS-O-S

$144.96Case /$6.04ea                       
Case=24pcs

14 ITEM-00186 - Inmate Shirt - Orange - Size Med 00186 $5.50 $247.57  $7.02ea  Case= 50pcs $81.00 Case /$6.75ea                       
Case =12pcs VFS-O-M

$144.96Case /$6.04ea                       
Case=24pcs

15 ITEM-00187 - Inmate Shirt - Orange - Size Lg 00187 $5.50 $247.57  $7.02ea  Case= 50pcs $81.00 Case/ $6.75ea                      
Case =12pcs VFS-O-L

$144.96Case /$6.04ea                       
Case=24pcs

16 ITEM-00188 - Inmate Shirt - Orange - Size Xl 00188 $5.50 $247.57  $7.02ea  Case= 50pcs $84.00 Case  /$7.00ea                     
Case =12pcs VFS-O-XL

$144.96Case /$6.04ea                       
Case=24pcs

17 ITEM-00189 - Inmate Shirt - Orange - Size 2xl 00189 $5.50 $247.57 $7.43ea  Case= 50pcs  $87.00 Case/ $7.25ea                      
Case =12pcs VFS-O-2XL

$144.96Case /$6.04ea                       
Case=24pcs

18 ITEM-00190 - Inmate Shirt - Orange - Size 3xl 00190 $5.50 $256.89 $7.43ea Case= 50pcs $90.00 Case /$7.50ea                       
Case =12pcs VFS-O-3XL

$152.88Case /$6.37ea                       
Case= 24pcs

19 ITEM-00191 - Inmate Shirt - Orange - Size 4xl 00191 $5.50 $266.21   $8.29ea Case= 40pcs $93.00 Case/$7.75ea                       
Case =12pcs VFS-O-4XL

160.56Case/ $6.69ea                        
Case=$24pcs

20A  20A $32.32 pair                                 
Min. Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

20B  20B- Shoe Corp $49.75                   
Min.Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

21A 21A-$32.32 pair                                
Min. Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

21B 21B- Shoe Corp $49.75               
Min.Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

22A 22A- $32.32 pair                                
Min Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

22B 22B- Shoe Corp $49.75                
Min.Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

23A 23A- $32.32 pair                               
Min. Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

23B 23B- Shoe Corp $49.75             
Min.Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

24A 24A- $32.32 pair                               
Min. Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

24B 24B- Shoe Corp $49.75                   
Min.Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

$23.59

$23.59

$23.59

$23.59

$23.59

$27.25 pair B625-7

$27.25 pair  B625D-8

$27.25 pair  B625D-9

$27.25 pair B625D-10

$27.25 pair B625D-6No Bid 297.36 Case=12pair            
$24.78ea

No Bid 297.36 Case=12pair            
$24.78ea

ITEM-00209 - Inmate Boot - Size 10 00209 No Bid 297.36 Case=12pair            
$24.78ea

297.36 Case=12pair            
$24.78ea

No Bid

No Bid

00200

00205

297.36 Case=12pair            
$24.78eaITEM-00200 - Inmate Boot - Size 7

ITEM-00205 - Inmate Boot - Size 8

ITEM-00206 - Inmate Boot - Size 9 00206

ITEM-00210 - Inmate Boot - Size 6 00210
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25A 25A- $32.32 pair                                                         
Min. Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

25B 25B- Shoe Corp $49.75                                          
Min.Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

26A 26A- $32.32 pair                               
Min. Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

26B 26B- Shoe Corp $49.75                                          
Min.Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

27A 27A- $32.32 pair                                                         
Min. Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

27B 27B- Shoe Corp $49.75                                          
Min.Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

28A 28A- $32.32 pair                                                         
Min. Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

28B 28B- Shoe Corp $49.75                                          
Min.Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

29A 29A- $32.32 pair                                         
Min. Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

29B 29B- Shoe Corp $49.75                                          
Min.Order 12 pair can be mixed sizes

30 ITEM-00347 - Inmate Shoe Lace 00347 No Bid $54.72 per bundle $23.60 Gross 60 dozen $80.00 Case =144pcs                           
Min. Order 2 Cases JZ-918-16898-BLK

$1.00

31 ITEM-00364 - Inmate Shirt - Disposable - Size Med 00364 No Bid $250.29 100.00 Case $74.00 Case=50pcs                   
ZDSCRTNV-M

$1.07

32 ITEM-00365 - Inmate Shirt - Disposable - Size Xl 00365 No Bid $250.29 100.00 Case $74.00 Case=50pcs                    
ZDSCRTNV-XL

$1.07

33 ITEM-00369 - Inmate Pant - Disposable - Size Med 00369 No Bid $255.88 110.00 Case $78.00 Case=50pcs                         
ZDSCRPNV-M

$1.07

34 ITEM-00370 - Inmate Pant - Disposable - Size Xl 00370 No Bid $255.88 110.00 Case $81.00 Case=50pcs                        
ZDSCRPNV-XL

$1.07

35 ITEM-00371 - Inmate Shirt - Disposable - Size 3xl 00371 No Bid $261.47 100.00 Case $79.00 Case=50pcs                 
ZDSCRTNV-3XL

$1.07

36 ITEM-00941 - Inmate Shoe Insert 00941 No Bid No Bid 18.60 Dozen $75.00 Case=48pcs                         
INSOLEM-OSFA

$7.21

37 ITEM-00945 - Inmate Pant - Disposable - Size 3Xl 00945 No Bid $267.06 110.00 Case $84.00 Case=50pcs                  
ZDSCRPNV-3XL

$1.07

38 ITEM-01969 - Inmate Shirt - Orange-Size 5xl 01969 $5.50 $274.13 $8.87ea $96.00 Case=12pcs                               
VFS-O-5XL

$7.00

1 Case

ASAP 30-90 Days 21-30Days
Disposable Pants & Shirts 14-21 Days Value Fit 

Pants & Shirts with Screening 2000pcs or less 14-21 
Days > 2000pcs 60-90 Days

7-10 Days ARO

Bidding on Shirts and Pants Only All 
or None

$23.59

$23.59

No Bid 297.36 Case=12pair            
$24.78ea

$27.25 pair B625D-14

$27.25 pair B625D-15

No Bid 297.36 Case=12pair            
$24.78ea

$23.59

$23.59

$27.25 pair B625D-11

$27.25 pair B625D-12

$27.25 pair B625D-13 $23.59ITEM-00213 - Inmate Boot - Size 13 00213

No Bid 297.36 Case=12pair            
$24.78ea

No Bid 297.36 Case=12pair            
$24.78ea

ITEM-00211 - Inmate Boot - Size 11 00211 No Bid 297.36 Case=12pair            
$24.78ea

Exceptions

Delivery Days

Min. Order

ITEM-00212 - Inmate Boot - Size 12 00212

ITEM-00215 - Inmate Boot - Size 15 00215

ITEM-00214 - Inmate Boot - Size 14 00214


	2024-002 Inmate Uniforms & Acc

