== HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY
- SHERIFF'S OFFICE
2008 EastErrmrAveve
Taza FL33605

FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
ORIENT ROAD WAREHOUSE

BryaN CHANDIFR

BUYER

Initial Award
(§15) 247- 5065

BCHANDIER@TEAMHCSO.coM

BID NUMBER: 2025-020

Inmate Linens, Bath Towels, and Undergarments
Opened: January 8, 2026

Initial Award: May 12, 2026 Time: 8:00am
[Expires: May 12, 2029

Change Order #:

Renewal 1 EXP:

Renewal 2 EXP:

HCSO Supplier SI-4897 HCSO Supplier SI-13345 HCSO Supplier SI-301744

Bob Barker Company
7925 Purfoy Road
Fuquay Varina, NC. 27526

Charm-Tex
1618 Coney Island Avenue
Brooklyn, NY. 11280

S & A International
2375 Murphy Boulevard, Suite A
Gainesville GA. 30504

Betsy Copeland
(919)753-1654
Betsy Copeland@bobbarker.com

Salim Amirali
(404)404-480-4440

info@gosaint.com

Stand Danzger
(718)252-8100
Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award stan@charm-tex.com

Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewals

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Blanket (00059): Gray, 100% recycled materials (Poly, Acrylic,
Cotton), 66” x 90” finished size, machine washable & dryable,
hemmed on all four sides with lock stitched manufacturer’s label
to identify origin and material content.

$5.40ea / $54.00 C10
#CZ6690GY A
Premium Cozy Blanket

Sold By C10. Min. Order 300ea / 30C10.

ARO 5 Days

$6.09¢a #BL/Lcimball 12per Case ARO
30 Days
No Sample Submitted

$4.75ea #BL6696SF 50per Case White
Thermal Blanket Size 66x90 100% Cotton
Snag Free Min. Order 1440 ARO 3 Days

Fitted Sheet (00181): White, 50% cotton / 50% polyester (+/-
5%), weight of 4.3 ounces per square yard, finished size to fit
mattress size 30” x 76” x 57, lengthwise edge to be salvage
edged, elastic to go across full crosswise grain (with elastic size
of 3/8”, +/- 1/8”), elastic shall be lock stitched, shrinkage not to
exceed 5% with lock stitched manufacturer’s label to identify
origin and material content.

$3.40¢ca / $40.80dz #FS63636P
Fitted Sheet, T-180 36X75/80X6
Sold By Dozen. Min Order 200dz
MC/4 Dozen ARO 5 Days

$4.64¢ea #30756W80 60per Case ARO
30 Days

$2.30ea / $27.60dz T130 Fitted Sheet Size
36x76x8 White 50/50 Blended <5%

Shrinkage. Min. Order 450dz (5400ea) 5
Dozen/ Bale per Case ARO 3 Days

Flat Sheet (00182): White, 50% cotton / 50 % polyester (+/-
5%), weight of 4.3 ounces per square yard, finished size to fit
mattress size 30” x 76” x 57, lengthwise edge to be salvage
edged, crosswise grain edge to be hemmed and lock stitched,
shrinkage not to exceed 5% with lock stitched manufacturer’s
label to identify origin and material content.

$3.95¢ea / $47.40dz #SH66104P
Sheet, White, T-180 66X104 Sold By
Dozen. Min. Order 200dz MC/4 Dozen
ARO 5 Days

$2.98ea #66104W130 60per Case
ARO 30 Days

$2.20ea / $26.40dz T130 Flat Sheets Size
66x104 White 50/50 Blended <5% Shrinkange.
Min. Order 600dz (7200ea) 5 Dozen/ Bale per
Case ARO 3 Days

Pillow Case (00177): White, standard size, 50% cotton / 50%
polyester (+/- 5%), weight of 4.3 ounces per square yard, cut
size 427 x 347, finished size 21.5” x 297 (+/- 17), hem of 1 %"
(+/- 2”) to be lock stitched, seams constructed with safety stitch,
shrinkage not to exceed 5% with lock stitched manufacturer’s
label to identify origin and material content.

$1.17ea / $14.04cs #PC4234P Sold By
Dozen. Min. Order 17dz. ARO 5 Days

$0.88ca #4234W130 120per Case ARO
30 Days

$0.58ea / $6.96dz T130 Pillow Cases Size
42x34 White 50/50 Blended <5%

Shrinkange. Min. Order 75dz (900ea) 72
Each / Bale per Case ARO 3 Days



mailto:stan@charm-tex.com
mailto:info@gosaint.com

BryaN CHANDIFR

BUYER

(515) 247- 5068

e HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY
20 SHERIFF'S OFFICE

2008 EastErrmrAveve

Taza FL33605

FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
ORIENT ROAD WAREHOUSE

BCHANDIER@TEAMHCSO.coM

Initial Award

BID NUMBER: 2025-020

Inmate Linens, Bath Towels, and Undergarments
Opened: January 8, 2026

Initial Award: May 12, 2026 Time: 8:00am
[Expires: May 12, 2029

Change Order #:

Renewal 1 EXP:

Renewal 2 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award
Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewals

HCSO Supplier SI-4897

Bob Barker Company
7925 Purfoy Road
Fuquay Varina, NC. 27526

Betsy Copeland
(919)753-1654
Betsy Copeland@bobbarker.com

HCSO Supplier SI-13345

Charm-Tex
1618 Coney Island Avenue
Brooklyn, NY. 11280

Stand Danzger
(718)252-8100
stan@charm-tex.com

HCSO Supplier SI-301744

S & A International
2375 Murphy Boulevard, Suite A
Gainesville GA. 30504

Salim Amirali
(404)404-480-4440

info@gosaint.com

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Bath Towel (00232): White, 100% cotton and/or 85/15%
cotton/polyester blend, 20” x 40” minimum finished size, 22” x
44” maximum finished size, 5.5 to 6.0 pounds per dozen, must
be hemmed on all four sides with lock stitched manufacturer’s
label to identify origin and material content.

$1.10ea / $13.20dz #BT244A Bath Towel
White Sold By Dozen. Min. Order 400dz.
ARO 5 Days

$1.26ea #BT2040J55E 300per Case
ARO 30 Days

$0.93ea/ $11.16dz #1071 6LBS/Dozen White

Bath Towels Size 22x44 100% Cotton Min.
Order 260dz (3120ea) ARO 3 Days

Wash Cloth (00247): White, 86% cotton / 14% polyester, terry
cloth, 12 x 12” square finished size, hemmed on all four sides,
minimum weight of one pound per dozen with lock stitched
manufacturer’s label to identify origin and material content.

$.19ea / $2.28dz #WC224A Washcloth
White 12X12.751b. Sold By Dozen Min.
Order 500dz. MC/70 Dozen

$0.24ea #WC1212J10E 1200per Case
ARO 30 Days

$0.16ea / $1.92dz #1616ASS500 1LB/ Dozen
‘White Wash Cloth Size 12x12 86/14 Blended|

Min. Order 250dz (3000ea) 100dz / Bale
ARO 3 Days

G1A

Sports Bra: White, Two-ply, 65% cotton/30% polyester
/5% spandex, Pull-over style, No hooks, eyes, metal or
plastic components, Elasticized straps no less than 1 %5”
wide, traditional strap style, elasticized rib band Size
Range 32-38

$16.76dz / $201.12cs Size 32-38 EBASPLS
White Sports BRA Sold By Dozen. Min.
Order 100dz can mix sizes MC/12dz =144.
ARO 15-30 Days

$19.90dz Sizes 32-40 #CL/S BRA
120per Case ARO 30 Days

No Bid

G1B

Sports Bra: White, Two-ply, 65% cotton/30% polyester
/5% spandex, Pull-over style, No hooks, eyes, metal or
plastic components, Elasticized straps no less than 1 %5”
wide, traditional strap style, elasticized rib band Size
Range 40-44

$19.76dz / $237.12cs Size 40-44 EBASPLS
White Sports BRA Sold By Dozen. Min.
Order 100dz can mix sizes MC/12dz to size
42. MC/10dz size 44 =$197.60 ARO 15-30
Days

$20.87dz Sizes 42-48 #CL/S BRA
120per Case ARO 30 Days

No Bid

GI1C

Sports Bra: White, Two-ply, 65% cotton/30% polyester
/5% spandex, Pull-over style, No hooks, eyes, metal or
plastic components, Elasticized straps no less than 1 '%”
wide, traditional strap style, elasticized rib band Size
Range 46-54

$21.26dz / $212.60cs Size 46-54 EBASPLS
White Sports BRA Sold By Dozen. Min.
Order 100dz can mix sizes MC/10dz. ARO
15-30 Days

$23.18dz Sizes 50-56 #CL/S BRA
120per Case ARO 30 Days

No Bid



mailto:stan@charm-tex.com
mailto:info@gosaint.com

= HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY
SHERIFF'S OFFICE
2008 EasTErrms AVENLE
Tauea FL33605

BrYAN CHANDLER FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
BUYER ORIENT ROAD WAREHOUSE
(515) 2¢7-5065§  BCHANDLER@TEAMHCSO.coM Initial Award
BID NUMBER: 2025-020 HCSO Supplier SI-4897 HCSO Supplier SI-13345 HCSO Supplier SI-301744
Inmate Linens, Bath Towels, and Undergarments
Opened: January 8, 2026 Bob Barker Company Charm-Tex S & A International
Initial Award: May 12, 2026 Time: 8:00am 7925 Purfoy Road 1618 Coney Island Avenue 2375 Murphy Boulevard, Suite A
[Expires: May 12, 2029 Fuquay Varina, NC. 27526 Brooklyn, NY. 11280 Gainesville GA. 30504
Change Order #:
Renewal 1 EXP:
Renewal 2 EXP: Betsy Copeland Stand Danzger Salim Amirali
(919)753-1654 (718)252-8100 (404)404-480-4440
Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award Betsy Copeland@bobbarker.com stan@charm-tex.com info@gosaint.com
Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewals
HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD
Stenciling Requirement: Garment size to be
stenciled in numbers 17 to 1 %4” high by 1” to )
G2 . $6.52 Per Dozen $6.90 Per Dozen No Bid
1 %2” wide, on back, centered between straps,
in black ink only.
Women’s Panties: Brief style, 100% cotton, 34" $9.76dz Size 5-8 ELBLS-SIZE Panty, White
HIA elasticized trim around the waistband, %4 covered Cotton/ Poly. Sold By Dozen. Min. Order | $10.90dz Sizes 5-8 #CL/PANT 120per No Bid
elasticized leg opening, double panel crotch 200dz can mix sizes MC/25dz. ARO 15-30 Case ARO 30 Days
Size Range 5-8 Days
Women’s Panties: Brief style, 100% cotton, %” $11.01dz Size 9-12 ELBLS-SIZE Panty,
HIB elasticized trim around the waistband, %4 covered White Cotton/ Poly. Sold By Dozen. Min. |$13.54dz Sizes 9-11 #CL/PANT 120per No Bid
elasticized leg opening, double panel crotch Order 200dz can mix sizes MC/25dz. ARO Case ARO 30 Days
Size Range 9-13 15-30 Days
Women’s Panties: Brief style, 100% cotton, 34" $13.76dz Size 13,14,16,18 ELBLS-SIZE
HIC elasticized trim around the waistband, %4” covered Panty, White Cotton/ Poly. Sold By Dozen. | $15.18dz Sizes 12 and Up #CL/PANT No Bid
elasticized leg opening, double panel crotch Size | Min. Order 200dz can mix sizes MC/25dz. 120per Case ARO 30 Days
Range 14-18 ARO 15-30 Days
Stenciling Requirement: Garment size to be stenciled in
H2 ([numbers 17 to 1 2" high by 17 to 1 %4” wide, on left front $6.24 Per Dozen $6.90 Per Dozen No Bid
leg, in black ink only.
s . .. $14.26dz Size S-2XL EBXLSQ-SIZE
Men’s Boxers: White, Minimum 60% cotton /40% | - Wi S o1d By Dozen M%. Order |$16.00dz Sizes S-2XL #CL/Boxer ARO .
I1A | polyester blend, Fly front, 1 }2” elasticized waistband . . No Bid
. 250dz can mix all sizes. MC/10dz ARO 15- 30 Days
Size Range -SM - 2XL 30Days
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== HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY

SHERIFF'S OFFICE
2008 East B Avevie

Tavma FL 33605

FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
ORIENT ROAD WAREHOUSE

BryaN CHANDIFR

BUYER

(§15) 247- 5065 BCHANDIER@TEAMHCSO.coM

Initial Award

BID NUMBER: 2025-020

Inmate Linens, Bath Towels, and Undergarments
Opened: January 8, 2026

Initial Award: May 12, 2026 Time: 8:00am
[Expires: May 12, 2029

Change Order #:

Renewal 1 EXP:

Renewal 2 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award
Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewals

HCSO Supplier SI-4897

Bob Barker Company
7925 Purfoy Road
Fuquay Varina, NC. 27526

Betsy Copeland
(919)753-1654
Betsy Copeland@bobbarker.com

HCSO Supplier SI-13345

Charm-Tex
1618 Coney Island Avenue
Brooklyn, NY. 11280

Stand Danzger
(718)252-8100
stan@charm-tex.com

HCSO Supplier SI-301744

S & A International
2375 Murphy Boulevard, Suite A
Gainesville GA. 30504

Salim Amirali
(404)404-480-4440

info@gosaint.com

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Men’s Boxers: White, Minimum 60% cotton / 40%

$15.26dz Size 3XL-4XL EBXLSQ-SIZE
Boxer, White Sold By Dozen Min. Order

$18.18dz Sizes 3XL-4XL #CL/Boxer

lyester blend, Fly front, 1 %4 elasticized waistband . . i
1B | - polyesterblend, Fly front, 1 72 “elasticized waistoand | 51 o mix all sizes. MC/10dz ARO 15- ARO 30 Days No Bid
Size Range 3XL - 4XLL
30Days
. .. $15.26dz Size 5XL-6XL EBXLSQ-SIZE
Men’s B : White, M 60% cotton / 40% . . .
cn s Boxers e mlm,l,lm 0 co on‘ ’ Boxer, White Sold By Dozen Min. Order $19.90dz Sizes 5XL-6XL #CL/Boxer .
I1C polyester blend, Fly front, 1 }4” elasticized waistband . . No Bid
. 250dz can mix all sizes. MC/10dz ARO 15- ARO 30 Days
Size Range 5XL - 6XL
30Days
Stenciling Requirement: Garment size to be stenciled in
12 [numbers 17 to 1 4" high by 17 to 1 %4” wide, on left front $6.24 Per Dozen $6.90 Per Dozen No Bid
leg, in black ink only.
Crew Sock (10961): White, 80% cotton/ 20% polyester
blend, Ankle cuff approximately 2 4”, padded toe, Size $4.38dz #M4595 Ankle Sock Fits 8-12
J1 |requirements: OSFA (one size fits all) to accommodate Sold By Dozen. Min. Order 900dz $6.87dz #SCK/Crew 120per Case ARO No Bid

up to a size 13. Seconds and irregulars will not be
accepted.

MC/15dz ARO 5 Days

30 Days

¢ |Exceptions

panties are cotton/ polly blend. Fitted/ Flat
sheet is 55/45
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= HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY
27 SHERIFF'S OFFICE

2008 EAsT EIGHTH AVENLE
Tanvpa, FIL.33605

FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
ORIENT ROAD WAREHOUSE

BryaN CHANDIFR

BUYER

(§15) 247- 5065 BCHANDIER@TEAMHCSO.coM

Initial Award

BID NUMBER: 2025-020

Inmate Linens, Bath Towels, and Undergarments
Opened: January 8, 2026

Initial Award: May 12, 2026 Time: 8:00am
[Expires: May 12, 2029

Change Order #:

Renewal 1 EXP:

Renewal 2 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award
Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewals

HCSO Supplier SI-17443

Tabb Textile Co.
511 Pleasant Drive
Opelika, AL. 36801

Sarah Cook
(334)745-6762
tabb@textilegroup.net

HCSO Supplier SI-260707

Victory Supply
7025 Industrial Park Road
Mount Pleasant TN. 38474

Sondra Boston
(888) 376-1205
sales@victorysupplyinc.com

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Blanket (00059): Gray, 100% recycled materials (Poly, Acrylic,
Cotton), 66” x 90” finished size, machine washable & dryable,
hemmed on all four sides with lock stitched manufacturer’s label
to identify origin and material content.

$5.23ea / $62.76¢s #WB185 Blanket,
Gray, 55% Polyester / 30% Acrylic/10%
Cotton /5% Other Min. Order 1 Case

$6.94ea / $104.10cs #BLCMFYGY Comfy
Blanket, 15per Bale / Case ARO 7-10 Days

Fitted Sheet (00181): White, 50% cotton / 50% polyester (+/-
5%), weight of 4.3 ounces per square yard, finished size to fit
mattress size 30” x 76” x 57, lengthwise edge to be salvage

B |edged, elastic to go across full crosswise grain (with elastic size
of 3/8”, +/- 1/8”), elastic shall be lock stitched, shrinkage not to
exceed 5% with lock stitched manufacturer’s label to identify
origin and material content.

$3.44¢a / $206.40cs #FT135 Fitted Sheet

White 50% Cotton / 50% Polyester To fit

mattress 30" x76"x5" Min. Order 1 Case,
60per Case ARO Days

$4.11ea / 246.60cs #SHFIT30754WH White
Fitted Sheet 5dz per Case ARO 7-10 Days No
Sample Submitted

Flat Sheet (00182): White, 50% cotton / 50 % polyester (+/-
5%), weight of 4.3 ounces per square yard, finished size to fit
mattress size 30” x 76” x 57, lengthwise edge to be salvage

$1.58¢ea / $94.80cs #PS100 Flat Sheet
White 50% Cotton / 50% Polyester To fit

$2.38ca / $142.80cs #SH5490WH White Flat

¢ edged, crosswise grain edge to be hemmed and lock stitched, mattress 30" x76"x5" Min. Order 1 Case, Sheet 5dz per Case ARO 7-10 Days
shrinkage not to exceed 5% with lock stitched manufacturer’s 60per Case ARO Days
label to identify origin and material content.
Pillow Case (00177): White, standard size, 50% cotton / 50%
polyester (+/- 5%), weight of 4.3 ounces per square yard, cut $0.65 . .
.65ea / $156¢s #PC107 Pillowcase White o
ize 42” x 34”, finished size 21.5” x 29” (+/- 1), h f1%” . 1.09¢a / $65.40cs # PCWH4234 White Pill
p [size#27x 347 finished size 21.57x 297 (+/- 1), hem of 157 ) 424 Size 427x34", 50% Cotton 50% | S1-00¢2/ $65:40cs e Triow

(+/- 2”) to be lock stitched, seams constructed with safety stitch,
shrinkage not to exceed 5% with lock stitched manufacturer’s
label to identify origin and material content.

Polyester Min. Order 1 Case, 240per Case

Case 5dz per Case ARO 7-10 Days
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== HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY
- SHERIFF'S OFFICE
2008 EastErrmrAveve
Taza FL33605

FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
ORIENT ROAD WAREHOUSE

BryaN CHANDIFR

BUYER

(§15) 247- 5065 BCHANDIER@TEAMHCSO.coM

Initial Award

BID NUMBER: 2025-020

Inmate Linens, Bath Towels, and Undergarments
Opened: January 8, 2026

Initial Award: May 12, 2026 Time: 8:00am
[Expires: May 12, 2029

Change Order #:

Renewal 1 EXP:

Renewal 2 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award
Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewals

HCSO Supplier SI-17443

Tabb Textile Co.
511 Pleasant Drive
Opelika, AL. 36801

Sarah Cook
(334)745-6762
tabb@textilegroup.net

HCSO Supplier SI-260707

Victory Supply
7025 Industrial Park Road
Mount Pleasant TN. 38474

Sondra Boston
(888) 376-1205
sales@victorysupplyinc.com

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Bath Towel (00232): White, 100% cotton and/or 85/15%
cotton/polyester blend, 20” x 40” minimum finished size, 22” x
E |44” maximum finished size, 5.5 to 6.0 pounds per dozen, must
be hemmed on all four sides with lock stitched manufacturer’s
label to identify origin and material content.

$0.70ea / $210cs #BT506 Bath Towel
Whith 85% Cotton / 15% Polyester
20"x40", 5.51b/dz Min. Order 1 Case,
300per Case ARO Days

$0.97ea / $291cs #BTWH204055 White Bath
Towel 20x50, 5.51b 25dz per Bale /Case ARO
7-10 Days

Wash Cloth (00247): White, 86% cotton / 14% polyester, terry
F |cloth, 12” x 12” square finished size, hemmed on all four sides,
minimum weight of one pound per dozen with lock stitched

$0.16¢ea / $192cs #WC520 Washcloth
White 86% Cotton / 14% Polyester
12"x12", 1.0 Ib/dz Min. Order 1 Case,

$0.26¢a / $312cs #WCWHS8614 Wash Colth
White 100dz per Bale/ Case ARO 7-10 Days

manufacturer’s label to identify origin and material content. 1200per Case ARO Days

Sports Bra: White, Two-ply, 65% cotton/30% polyester

/5% spandex, Pull-over style, No hooks, eyes, metal or $20.74dz / $207.40cs Sizes 32 to 42
G1A |plastic components, Elasticized straps no less than 1 /42” No Bid #SBWHWSZ White Sports Bra with Stencil

wide, traditional strap style, elasticized rib band Size 10dz per Case ARO 7-10 Days

Range 32-38

Sports Bra: White, Two-ply, 65% cotton/30% polyester

/5% spandex, Pull-over style, No hooks, eyes, metal or $22.14dz / $221.40cs Sizes 44-48 #SBWHWSZ]
G1B [plastic components, Elasticized straps no less than 1 %5” No Bid ‘White Sports Bra with Stencil 10dz per Case

wide, traditional strap style, elasticized rib band Size ARO 7-10 Days

Range 40-44

Sports Bra: White, Two-ply, 65% cotton/30% polyester

/5% spandex, Pull-over style, No hooks, eyes, metal or $23.97dz / $239.70cs Sizes 50-56 #SBWHWSZj
G1C |[plastic components, Elasticized straps no less than 1 '5” No Bid ‘White Sports Bra with Stencil 10dz per Case

wide, traditional strap style, elasticized rib band Size
Range 46-54

ARO 7-10 Days
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= HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY

SHERIFF'S OFFICE
2008 East B Avevie

Tavma FL 33605

FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
ORIENT ROAD WAREHOUSE

BryaN CHANDIFR

BUYER

(§15) 247- 5065 BCHANDIER@TEAMHCSO.coM

Initial Award

BID NUMBER: 2025-020

Inmate Linens, Bath Towels, and Undergarments
Opened: January 8, 2026

Initial Award: May 12, 2026 Time: 8:00am
[Expires: May 12, 2029

Change Order #:

Renewal 1 EXP:

Renewal 2 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award
Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewals

HCSO Supplier SI-17443

Tabb Textile Co.
511 Pleasant Drive
Opelika, AL. 36801

Sarah Cook
(334)745-6762
tabb@textilegroup.net

HCSO Supplier SI-260707

Victory Supply
7025 Industrial Park Road
Mount Pleasant TN. 38474

Sondra Boston
(888) 376-1205
sales@victorysupplyinc.com

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Stenciling Requirement: Garment size to be
stenciled in numbers 1” to 1 4™ high by 1” to

G2 N No Bid Included in the above prices
1 %2” wide, on back, centered between straps, 1
in black ink only.
Women’s Panties: Brief style, 100% cotton, 34" )
. . . o $10.54dz / $263.50cs Sizes 5-8
elasticized trim around the waistband, %" covered . . .
H1A .. . No Bid #PNTYWHWSZ White Women's Panty with
elasticized leg opening, double panel crotch ) )
. Size Stencil 25dz per Case ARO 7-10 Days
Size Range 5-8
Women’s Panties: Brief style, 100% cotton, %” )
. . . o $11.84dz / $296¢s Sizes 9-13 #PNTYWHWSZ
elasticized trim around the waistband, %4” covered . ) . ) :
H1B .. . No Bid White Women's Panty with Size Stencil 25dz
elasticized leg opening, double panel crotch Case ARO 7-10 D
Size Range 9-13 per Lase . ays
Women’s Panties: Brief style, 100% cotton, 34" )
- . . L $12.43dz / $310.75¢s Sizes 14-18
elasticized trim around the waistband, ¥4” covered . L .
HI1C .. . . No Bid #PNTYWHWSZ White Women's Panty with
elasticized leg opening, double panel crotch Size . .
Size Stencil 25dz per Case ARO 7-10 Days
Range 14-18
Stenciling Requirement: Garment size to be stenciled in
H2 ([numbers 17 to 1 2" high by 17 to 1 %4” wide, on left front No Bid Included in the above prices
leg, in black ink only.
Men’s Boxers: White, Minimum 60% cotton / 40% $17.98dz / $179.80cs Size S-2XL. BXWHWSZ|
I1A | polyester blend, Fly front, 1 '%” elasticized waistband No Bid ‘White Boxer with Stencil 10dz per case ARO

Size Range -SM - 2XL

7-10 Days



mailto:tabb@textilegroup.net
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== HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY

SHERIFF'S OFFICE
2008 East B Avevie

Tavma FL 33605

FINANCIAL SERVICES DIVISION
ORIENT ROAD WAREHOUSE

BryaN CHANDIFR

BUYER

(§15) 247- 5065 BCHANDIER@TEAMHCSO.coM

Initial Award

BID NUMBER: 2025-020

Inmate Linens, Bath Towels, and Undergarments
Opened: January 8, 2026

Initial Award: May 12, 2026 Time: 8:00am
[Expires: May 12, 2029

Change Order #:

Renewal 1 EXP:

Renewal 2 EXP:

Terms: Three (3) Year Initial Award
Optional: Two (2) Additional Two (2) Year Renewals

HCSO Supplier SI-17443

Tabb Textile Co.
511 Pleasant Drive
Opelika, AL. 36801

Sarah Cook
(334)745-6762
tabb@textilegroup.net

HCSO Supplier SI-260707

Victory Supply
7025 Industrial Park Road
Mount Pleasant TN. 38474

Sondra Boston
(888) 376-1205
sales@victorysupplyinc.com

HIGHLIGHTED AREA INDICATES AWARD

Men’s Boxers: White, Minimum 60% cotton / 40%

$21.74dz / $217.40cs Size 3XL-4XL

I11B | polyester blend, Fly front, 1 %" elasticized waistband No Bid BXWHWSZ White Boxer with Stencil 10dz
Size Range 3XL - 4XL per case ARO 7-10 Days
Men’s Boxers: White, Minimum 60% cotton / 40% $23.24dz / $232.40cs Size S-2XL BXWHWSZ|
11C polyester blend, Fly front, 1 }4” elasticized waistband No Bid ‘White Boxer with Stencil 10dz per case ARO
Size Range 5XL - 6XL 7-10 Days
Stenciling Requirement: Garment size to be stenciled in
12 [numbers 1”7 to 1 4" high by 17 to 1 %4” wide, on left front No Bid Included in the above prices
leg, in black ink only.
Crew Sock (10961): White, 80% cotton/ 20% polyester
blend, Ankle cuff approximately 2 2", padded toe, Size .
J1 |requirements: OSFA (one size fits all) to accommodate No Bid §5.17dz /$103.40cs #SKCRWH White Crew

up to a size 13. Seconds and irregulars will not be
accepted.

Sock 20dz per case ARO 7-10 Days

« |Exceptions
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