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General Services Bureau
Carly Cartwright, GM1
(813) 247-0026

BID NUMBER:

Bid 9-19 Duty Gear
Opened: July 16, 2019
Awarded: July 30, 2019
1st Renewal Exp:

Terms: One (1) Year Initial Award

GT Distributors, Inc.
2545 Brockton Drive Ste 100
Austin, TX 78758
Ph: 800-252-8310
Fx: 800-480-5845

Sandi White

Lawmen's & Shooters' Supply
7750 9th Street SW
Vero Beach, FL 32968
Ph: 800-562-5697
Fx: 772-569-2955

Gail Walker-Keen

Dana Safety
3810-A W. Hillsborough Ave
Tampa, FL 33614
Ph: 813-348-4866
Fx: 813-375-8347

Mark Sevigny

Three (3) Annual Renewals sandi.white@gtdist.com bids@lawmans.net msevigny@1dss.com
(YELLOW AREA INDICATES AWARD)
NLIJtrirtr)‘er DESCRIPTION OF ITEMS: BASKET WEAVE
10212 |aop o IO 2432 $31.19 $34.62 / min 5 $29.25
10884 S{XVNBCIIE-III(; E(E:I(E:TJ?/IFEDSL(DAFIIEDS‘?EK)ZZOgl vl NO BID NO BID
10903 EfXVN(éﬂg ACCUMOLD ELITE 22063 el NOBID NO BID
10904 SfXVNgLHIO(:)/ i((::éjl\EAOLD ELITE 22962 vl NO BID NO BID
10921 |0\t ACCUMOLD ELITE 22103 52059 NO BID NOBID
10924 |o i\ e ACCUMOLD ELITE 22076 SIZ€ 02 527,94 NO 81D NO 81D
Various EIX{I?SUEPYlEELT 2-1/47, UNLINED, SIZES 22-54 NO BID NO BID NO BID
11400 ;ﬁﬁigﬁ/?ﬁ%i@z?sm BW 364-481 RH O NO BID NO BID
L1401 |G eND® 6520 STX BW 364482 LH IR NOBID NO BID
e e | Il ANDS® Wi LIGHT. R 7360-28327 481-MS0 128,66 NO BID NOBID
New e | AR ANDS Wi LIGHT: Lt 7360-28327-452-MS40 128,66 N BID NO BID
11766 EIQI:/?LO?UCFX\"‘I'I%LIJ:H—;HF%LSDO%FSQGO $31.73 $27.20/ min 5 $29.25
11286 ;ﬁigg ;(ég;i?(lig,TER -RH $35.28 $35.45 / min of 5 any combo $33.15
11287 gﬁigs .)r(ég:?(légTER -LH $35.28 $35.45 / min of 5 any combo $33.15
New Item gﬁigg 1)'(?(53'!34 l_)glésTER -RH $35.28 $35.45 / min of 5 any combo $33.15
New Item gﬁigg 1)'(?(53'!34 l_)glésTER -LH $35.28 $35.45 / min of 5 any combo $33.15
Time for Delivery ARO 60 Days 30-45 Days 30 Days
Exceptions None None None
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